Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 33, No. 251—30th November, 1994 465

LEGAL NoticE No. 213
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO
THE PROVISIONAL COLLECTION OF TAXES AcT, CHAP. 74:01
ORDER

MADE BY THE PRESIDENT UNDER SECTION 3 OF THE PROVISIONAL
CoLLECTION OF TAXES ACT

THE PROVISIONAL COLLECTION OF TAXES ORDER, 1994

1. This Order may be cited as the Provisional Collection of Taxes Citation
Order, 1994.

2. The Petty Civil Courts Rules are amended in the First Schedule— Chapﬁl
amend

(@) under the heading “In Actions over $1,200 or for the
Recovery of Land or for the Delivery of Specific Goods”, by
deleting the word “4.00” and substituting the word “8.00”;
and

(b) under the heading “General”, by deleting the words “1.00”
and “.50” and substituting the words “2.00” and “1.00”
respectively.

3. The Gambling and Betting Act is amended— Chap. 11:19
(@) in section 28, by deleting subsection (3) and substituting ™%
the following subsections:

“ (3) A person who contravenes the provisions of
subsection (1), is guilty of an offence and is liable on
summary conviction to a fine of fifty thousand dollars,
or to imprisonment for two years.

(4) A person who places or negotiates a bet with
another person who is in contravention of subsection (1),
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary
conviction to a fine of five thousand dollars or
imprisonment for three months.”;

(b) in section 29, by deleting subsection (2) and substituting
the following subsection:
“ (2) Any person who meets the requirements of
paragraph 14 of the First Schedule, and whose premises
meet the requirements of paragraph 15 of the said
Schedule, may apply for a licence to operate a betting
office.”; ’




466

Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

(c) by deleting section 34, and substituting the following

“National tote
system

section:

34. (1) There shall be established for the purpose of
regulating betting by way of tote, forecast, trifecta or
other pool betting, a National Tote System (hereinafter
called “the system”).

(2) The system shall be administered by an
approved Authority which shall be responsible for the
provision of all totalisators at all licensed betting pool
outlets, or betting pool offices, licensed for the purpose of
the system.

(3) Subject to this section, the provisions of
sections 28 to 31, and the First Schedule apply mutatis
mutandis to the betting office outlets as it applies to the
betting offices.

(4) There shall be charged at the rate of ten per
cent a levy on all bets placed with the system in any
manner whatever, payable every week on the
Wednesday following the week in which the levy is
deducted.

(5) There shall be charged a licence fee of one
hundred dollars in respect of each race day and in
respect of each licensed betting outlet or each betting
pool licensed for the purpose of the system.

(6) The levy charged in respect of betting offices
in Tobago shall be at the rate of two and one half per
cent.

(7) Payment of the levy and licence fee charged
in accordance with this section shall be made to the
Betting Levy Board by the approved Authority.

(8) In this section “approved Authority” means
the Trinidad Race Club or any other body that has the
responsibility for live racing.";

(d) in section 36, by deleting subsections (1) to (6), and

substituting the following subsections:

“ (1) There shall be charged upon all bets placed at
fixed odds or starting prices in any manner whatever at
a licensed betting office, a levy at the rate of ten per cent
or an annual levy of four hundred thousand dollars
whichever is greater.




Provisional Colletion of Taxes Order, 1994 467

(2) The levy of ten per cent chargeable under
subsection (1) shall be paid to the Betting Levy Board by
the holder of the betting office licence appertaining to
the betting office, every week by the Wednesday
following the week in which the levy is deducted.

(3) The annual levy chargeable under subsection
(1), shall be paid in four quarterly instalments of one
hundred thousand dollars on or before 2nd January,
1st April, 1st July and 1st October of each year,
commencing in the year 1995.

(4) Where at the end of any quarter—

(a) the levy paid under subsection (3) is in excess
of the levy paid under subsection (2), the
Board shall make a refund of the levy paid
under subsection (2);

(b) the levy paid under subsection (2) is greater
than that paid under subsection (3), the
Board shall make a refund of the levy paid
under subsection (3).

(6) Where the licensee fails to pay the levy in
accordance with this section, he is guilty of an offence
and is liable on summary conviction to a fine of fifty
thousand dollars, or to imprisonment for six months and
in addition the licence may be revoked.

(6) Where a licensee pays the levy at the rate of ten
per cent, the taking of any bet which is not charged at
that rate is deemed to be an offence and is punishable in
accordance with section 28(3).”;

(e) in the First Schedule—
(1) by deleting paragraph 14(e); and

(ii) in paragraph 17, by deletidg all the words after
the word “advance” in subparagraph (2)(a) and
inserting after subparagraph (2), the following
subparagraph:

“ (3) The fees payable under this section
shall be paid on or before 15th December in
the year prior to the year for which the
licence is required.”;

(f) in the Fourth Schedule by deleting paragraph 1 and
substituting the following paragraph:
“ 1. The pool betting duty shall be paid to the Board

on Wednesday of every week in such manner as the
Board may direct.”.




468 Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994
Chap. 48:50 4. The Motor Vehicles and Road Traffic Act is amended in
amended

Appendix A of the Fourth Schedule as follows:
(@) in Part I by deleting item 1 and substituting the following

item:

143

1. Class of Description of Motor Vehicles
(1) Private motor cars or rented cars,
station wagons or estate wagons:

(a)
(b)

(c)

(@

(e)

o

(g

(k)

Engine size exceeding 999 cc
Engine size exceeding 999 cc but
not exceeding 1499 cc ...
Engine size exceeding 1499 cc bu
not exceeding 1799 cc .
Engine size exceeding 1799 cc but
not exceeding 1999 cc .
Engine size exceeding 1999 cc but
not exceeding 2499 cc
Engine size exceeding 2499 cc but
not exceeding 2999 cc
Engine size exceeding 2999 cc but
not exceeding 3499 cc

Engine size exceeding 3499 cc

(2) Taxis:

(a)
(®)

(c)

@)

(e)

"

(8

(k)

Engine size not exceeding 999 cc
Engine size exceeding 999 cc but
not exceeding 1499 cc

Engine size exceeding 1499 cc but
not exceeding 1799 cc

Engine size exceeding 1799 cc but
not exceeding 1999 cc

Engine size exceeding 1999 cc but
not exceeding 2499 cc

Engine size exceeding 2499 cc but
not exceeding 2999 cc

Engine size exceeding 2999 cc but
not exceeding 3499 cc

Engine size exceeding 3499 cc

(3) Maxi-Taxis:

(a)
®)

Engine size not exceeding 2499 cc
Engine size exceeding 2499 cc

(4) Goods Vehicles

Vehicle Tax

$1.00 per cc
$2.00 per cc
$4.00 per cc
$8.00 per cc
$21.00 per cc
$25.00 per cc

$30.00 per cc
$45.00 per cc

$0.75 per cc

$1.50 per cc

$ 3.00 per cc

$6.00 per cc

$15.75 per cc

$18.75 per cc

$22.50 per cc
$33.75 per cc

$6.00 per cc
$8.00 per cc

$2.50 per cc”;



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

469

() in Part II under the heading “RELIEF FOR CITIZENS
RETURNING FROM ABROAD”—

(i) by inserting before the word “(a)” occurring in
line one the word “1.”;

(ii) by deleting item 1(a) (ii) as renumbered;

(iii) by adding after item “1” as renumbered, the
following item:

2. A returning national who imports a
motor vehicle into Trinidad and Tobago shall,

Chap. 78:01 upon satisfying the relevant conditions
stipulated in section 45 of the Customs Act, be
entitled to exemption from motor vehicles tax
in respect of the motor vehicle.”.

[

5. (1) The Income Tax Act is amended—

(@) in section 5, by inserting after subsection (64) the following
subsections:

“ (6B) The provisions of subsection (6)(a) and (b)
shall apply to a payment not otherwise chargeable to
tax which is made, whether in pursuance of any legal
obligation or not, either directly or indirectly, in
consideration or in consequence of, or otherwise in
connection with, the termination of the holding of an
office or employment or any change in its functions or
emoluments, including any payment in commutation
of annual or periodical payments, whether chargeable
to tax or not, which would otherwise have been made.

(6¢) For the purposes of subsection (6B), any
payment made to the spouse or any relative or
dependant of a person who holds or has held an office
or employment, or made on behalf of or to the order of
that person, shall be treated as a payment made to
that person, and any valuable consideration other
than money shall be treated as a payment of money
equal to the value of that consideration at the date

Chap. 75:01
amended



N
470 ‘ Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

when it was given.

(6D) A payment referred to in subsection (6B) does
not include a lumpsum payment made—

(1) under an approved pension scheme under
section 28;

(ii) under an approved pension fund plan or an
approved deferred annuity plan under
section 28;

(iii) under a fund or contract approved by the
Board under section 134(6);

(iv) in connection with the termination of the
holding of an office or employment by the
death of the holder or made on account of the
injury to or disability of the holder of the
office or employment.”;

(b) in section 5a—

(1) in subsection (1), by deleting the words “0.25 per
cent” and substituting the words “0.5 per cent”;

(ii) by repealing subsections (3) and (4) and
substituting the following subsection:

€€

(38) A person is entitled to a tax credit
against his business levy liability for a year of
income of any payment made in respect of his
income tax liability for that year of income up
to a maximum of his business levy liability.”;

(c) in section 8(1) by inserting the following paragraph:

“(v) with effect from the 1st December, 1994 income
earned by a trust carrying on unit trust business
Act No. as defined in the Financial Institutions Act, 1993
18/1993 where the trustee is a financial institution
licensed under the Financial Institutions Act
which sells shares representing interests in the
assets of the trust to beneficiaries under the
trust.”;

(d) in section 11(2), by inserting after the words “subsection



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

471

(e) by inserting after section 11, the following sections:

“Computa-
tion of wear
and tear
allowances

11A. (1) For the purpose of computing the

allowance under section 11(1)(b) for a year of
income in respect of—

(a) any plant and machinery;

(b) any buildings used exclusively to

house such plant and machinery,

acquired after 1st January, 1995, the plant
and machinery or the buildings housing such
plant and machinery shall be classified into a
class specified in the Seventh Schedule and
the wear and tear percentage relating to that
class shall be applied against the expenditure
incurred in acquiring the plant and
machinery or buildings housing such plant
and machinery.

(2) In computing the allowance
applicable to several items in a class specified
in the Seventh Schedule, the wear and tear
percentage relating to that class shall be
applied against the aggregate expenditure
incurred in acquiring the several plant and
machinery or buildings housing such plant
and machinery within that class.

(3) Where the plant and machinery or
the buildings under section 11(1)(b) cannot be
placed into\ a class under the Seventh
Schedule, the Board may apply such wear and
tear percentagg as may be determined by it
by reference to the anticipated normal
working life of the plant and machinery or the

buildings housing such plant and machinery.

(4) For the purposes of this section,
“anticipated normal working life” means, in
relation to plant and machinery or buildings
housing such plant and machinery, the period
which might be expected, when the plant and
machinery or the buildings housing such
plant and machinery are first put into use, to
elapse before they are finally put out of use as
being unfit for further use, it being assumed
that they will be used in the normal manner
and to the normal extent and are going to be
so used throughout that period.



472

Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

Allowances
on buildings
and
structures

11B.(1) Subject to subsection (6), for the
purpose of ascertaining the chargeable
income of a person carrying on a trade,
business, profession or vocation for a year of
income, there shall be allowed as a wear and
tear allowance an amount equal to ten per
cent on a declining balance of the capital
expenditure incurred by that person—

(a) in the construction of a building or
structure; or

(b) in respect of capital improvements
made to a building or structure,

completed on or after 1st January, 1995 and
used in the trade, business, profession or
vocation for the production of the income of
that person for that year of income.

(2) Where part of the building or
structure is to be used in the production of
income of a person under subsection (1) and
the capital expenditure incurred in the
construction of that part of the building which
is not used in the production of the income—

(a) does not exceed one tenth of the total
capital expenditure incurred in the
construction of or improvements to
the entire building or structure, the
allowance granted in subsection (1)
shall apply to the total capital
expenditure incurred in the
construction of the building or
structure or in the capital
improvements made to the building or
structure; _

(b) exceeds one tenth but does not exceed
one half of the total capital
expenditure incurred in the
construction of or improvements to
the entire building or structure, the
allowance granted in subsection (1)
shall apply only to the capital
expenditure incurred in the
construction of or improvements to
that part of the building or structure
which is to be used in the production
of income;



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

473

P.C.2

(c) exceeds one half of the total capital
expenditure incurred in the
construction of or improvements to
the entire building or structure, no
allowance shall be granted under
subsection (1).

(3) Where the building or structure is
used in the production of income for part of a
year of income, the allowance granted under
subsection (1) shall be reduced by a
proportionate part equivalent to the period
during which the building or structure was
not used for the production of income.

(4) A person whose income derived
from premiums and rents is exempt from tax
under section 42(2)(b) or section 45A(2) may,
in ascertaining his chargeable income for a
year of income, at his option elect to claim—

(a) the exemption under those
sections; or

(b) the allowance granted under
subsection (1).

(5) A person who makes an election
under subsection (4) shall do so in writing to
the Board in the financial year in which the
construction or the capital improvements
were completed and such election shall be
irrevocable.

(6) Notwithstanding subsection (1), no
allowance shall be made to a person for a year
of income where the person is entitled to
benefits under—

(a) the Fiscal Incentives Act;
(b) the Hotel Development Act;
(¢) the Trinidad and Tobago Free
Zones Act, 1988,
in respect of the building or structure or the
capital improvements made to the building or
structure.

(7) The provisions of Part I of the
Income Tax (In Aid of Industry) Act relating
to initial and annual allowances on industrial
buildings and structures shall not apply to a
person entitled to an allowance under this
section.

Chap. 85:01
Chap. 85:02

Act No. 19 of
1988

Chap. 86:04



476 Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

(m) by repealing the Fourth Schedule and substituting the
following Schedule:

“FOURTH SCHEDULE
(Section 56)
D1vIDEND INCOME ALLOWANCE

1. The income of any person from any distribution made by a
resident company, other than a listed resident company, in a year of
income shall be taken to be one hundred and sixty-two per cent of
the distribution actually made.

2. Where the income under item 1 is included in the chargeable
income of a person, there shall be set off for the purposes of
collection against the tax payable by such person an amount equal
to sixty-two per cent of the distribution actually made.

3. Where a person receives from a listed resident company in a
year of income a distribution which is subject to tax under section
554, there shall be set off for the purposes of collection against the
tax payable by such person, an amount equal to sixty-two per cent of
the distribution actually made.”;

(n) by inserting after the Sixth Schedule the following

Schedule:
“SEVENTH SCHEDULE
(Section 114a)
CLASS A (WEAR aND TEAR RATE) 10%
Rate

%
Buildings (Housing machinery)—Industrial .. 10
Buildings (Housing machinery)—Other .. 10
Shop Fittings ... e w10
Furniture—Household . 10
Roadmaking Plant—Utensils for drawmg .. 10
Dictaphones .. 10
Doctors—Instruments .. 10
Sea-craft . e .. 10
Poultry Fa.rmers—Egg Grader .. 10
Coffee Manufacturing . 10
Dentists—Fittings . 10
Vacuum Cleaners .. 10
Cylinders—Gas ... .. 10
Medical Practxtxoners—lnstmments .. 10
Adding Machines & Calculators—Manual ... .. 10
Newspaper Equipment—Linotype metal ... .. 10
Brick-making Plant—Walls and Windbreak .. 10
Irrigation—Water Supply - ... .. 10
Water Tanks and Pumps . . 10
Boats—Motor ... .. 10
Poultry Farmers——Eggboxes and Fxllers . 10
Radio Transceiver sets ... .. 10
Photography Equipment .. 10

Boats—Pontoons ... . 10



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994 477

Rate

%
Wireless Sets ... . 10
Ice Company Plant-—Refngerator v 10
PBX Systems ... . 10
Fixtures and Fittings ... .. 10
Motor Boats .. 10
Filing Cabinets ... .. 10
Calculating Machmee—Hand-operated we e 10
Newspaper Equipment—Type ... . . 10
Office Machines & Eqmpment—Addressograph .. 10
Dentists—Instruments . . 10
Cameras ... . 10
Bakers’ Plant ... . 10
Safes . . 10
Billiard Tables ... . 10
Scales—Weighbridge ... .. 10
Boats—Rowing and Sailing ... .. 10
Cash Registers—Manual .. 10
Boats—Punts ... o 10
Office Machines & Equlpment-—Cash Reglsters . 10
Fire Extinguishers . 10
Cigarette—Manufacturing Machmery .. 10
Weighbridges ... e . 10
Cigarette—Tools & Eqmpment . 10
Lighters ... .. 10
Cigarette Papers—Cuttmg & Foldmg Plant .. 10
Boats—Lighters ... .. 10
Office Machines & Eqmpment—'l‘elephones w 10
Newspaper Equipment—Stereos & Blocks ... . . 10
Office Machines & Equipment—Proof Machmes—Banks . 10
Boats—Barges ... .. 10
Medical Practxtloners—Radmm Plaques and Needles . 10
Hydraulic Jacks ... .. 10
Office Machines & Equlpment—chtaphones .. 10

CLASS B (WEAR AND TEAR RATE) 25%

Office Machines & Equipment—Calculating Machines .. 25

Railway Sidings ... . 25
Office Machines & Equlpment—Duphcatmg Machmes . 25
Furniture—Office v . 25
Dentists—Electric Motors 1... . 25
Electrical Fittings .. 25
Medical Practmoners—ngh Frequency Current Machmes . 9B
Neon Signs . 25
Dentists—Furniture ... w 25
Carpets (Cost over $500) w 25
Medical Practitioners—Electro- Cardlog'raph . 25
Radios, Radiograms and Phonographs . 25
Typewriters . 25
Calculating Machmes—Electrlcal . 2B
Office Machines & Equipment—Adding Machmes . 25
Brick-making Plant—Railway Siding . 25
Bucket Elevator-—Quarrymg . 25
Brewery Plant ... w 25

Transformers = ... . 25



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

Dentists—Carpets

Office Machines & Equlpment—Aocountmg Machmes
Hollman Compressors ... .

Welding Units

Water Coolers

Accounting Machines

Poultry Farmers—Incubators ...

Pumps

Office Machines & Equlpment——’l‘ypewnters
Dumpers—Quarrying .
Medical Practitioners—Other Plant

Stone Crushing Plant

Roadmaking Plant—Office Machmery
Adding Machines & Calculators—Electrical

Cold Stores & Ice Manufacturmg—Machmery & Plant

Lifts and Elevators

Dies

Refrigerating Plant & Machmery
Dentists—Plant ... .
Bookbinding Plant and Machmery——Bmlers
Live Network

Cold Stores & Ice Manufacturmg—Ice Cans
Radio Equipment . .
Elevators & Lifts..

Loudspeakers and Phones

Boats—Tugs .

Match Factory Plant

Ice Company Plant—Ice Crusher

Medical Practitioners—Diathermy Plant
Boot and Shoe-making—Boilers

Boot and Shoe-making—General Plau.t and Machmery

Boats—Launches

Boot and Shoe- makmg—.ﬁox (Cardboard) Manufacturers

Machinery

Ice Company Plant—Water Fllter

Beverage Coolers .

Diesel Engines & Motors

Medical Practitioners—Ophthalmic Surgeon s Plant
Boilers—Engines, Shafting .

Plastic Extrusion Machine

Boilers

Containers- makers Plant

Newspaper Equipment—Printing Machmes
Medical Practitioners—X-Ray Plant .

Ice Company Plant—Cold Storage Plant
Newspaper Equipment—Engines & Shaftmg

Ice Company Plant—Ice Breaker

Newspaper Equipment—Boilers

Laundry Plant—Washing Machines ... . e
Millinery Manufacturing Plant—Sewing Machlnes‘
Clothing & Millinery—Sewing Machines v
Confectioners’ Machinery

Ice Company Plant—Coils

Sewing Machines

Boilers—Engines, Shafting



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994 479

Rate

%
Biscuit-Making Plant ... . 25
Boilers—General Binding Machmery and Plant . 25
R.H.F. Welding Machine vor . 25
Dredges ... w 25
Cotton Knitting & Spmnmg Plant w 25
Ship building Plant . w o 25
Molasses Industry—Punts w 25
Aerated Water Plant—Bottling Plant . 25
Molasses Industry—Pipe Lines o 25
Coconut Qil Manufacturing Plant ... e . 25
Molasses Industry—Concrete sump and gear .. 25
Clothing & Millinery—Other Plant ... w 25
Milk Treatment Plant ... . w 25
Clothing & Mxlhnery—Manufacturmg Plant . 25
Generators .o . 25
Cement and Concrete Tlle——Manufactunng Plant v . 25
Roadmaking Plant—Asphalt Plant ... e .. 25
Sugar Industry—Boilers, auxiliaries, steam piping . 25
Printing Press ... w 25
Quarrying Plant & Machmery o 25
Molasses Industry—Pumps ... .. 25
Air conditioning Equipment—Single Umts w 25
Molasses Industry—Mill Storage w 25
Sugar Industry—Distilling Plant ... . 25
Laundry Plant—General Plant . 25
Brick-making Plant—Grog Crusher ... . 25
Distillery Plant ... . w 25
Brick-making Plant—Tunnel lens and Dryers . 25
Molasses Industry—Storage Tanks ... . . 25
Sugar Industry—Drainage and Irrigation Plant . 25
Engineering Works . 25
Millinery Manufacturing Plant—Other Plant w 25
Rum Refinery Plant ... . 25
Sugar Industry—Factory e . 25
Ice Company Plant—Factory Plant and Machmery . 25
Concrete Mixers ... . 25
Computers . 25
Oxygen Acetylene Plant . 25
Compressors —Ammonia—Vertical ... w 25
Mobile site office—caravan ... . 25
Compressors—Ammo ma—-—Honzontal v e e D
Ice Company Plant—Fabric Inserted Matting w 25
Compressors—Air and oxygen types ... w 25
Automotive Equipment ... . .. 25
Boats—Sloops and Streamers Ocean-gomg . 25
Bicycles—Motor ... . 25
Roadmaking Plant—Crawler Loader . 25
Oxygen Manufacturing Plant . e .. 25
Roadmaking Plant—Loader ... . 25
Motor Cars & Vehicles ... . 25
Copra . 25

Lorries (Motor) ... . 25




480 Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

Rate
%
Roadmaking Plant—Service Cars ... . 25
Bicycles—Ordinary—Commercial ... . 25
Aircraft—Commercial—new ... . 25
Drying Kilns . 25
Vulcanizing Machine ... . 25
Steel Barrels .. 25
Air Conditioning Equipment—Large general unit ... . 25
Caravans—Mobile site office ... . 25
Roadmaking Plant—Rollers and Steam ... . 25
Television Sets ... w 25
Arc and Gas Welding Plant ... .. 25
Brick-making Plant—Traxcavator ... . 25
Roadmaking Plant—Motor Dumper ... .. 25
Roadmaking Plant—Barbergreen Finisher ... . 25
Roadmaking Plant—Special Tools ... . 25
Boot and Shoe-making—Motor Vans & Lorries ... .. 25
CLASS C (WEAR AND TEAR RATE ) 33.3%
Farming Equipment ... . 33.3
Cutlassing Machine ... .. .. .. .. .. 333
Bulldozers ... .. 33.3
Forklift Trucks ... ... 333
Cranes—Electrical or otherwise .. 333
Aerated Water Plant—Bottles and Cases ... .. 333
Cranes—Gantries’ we .. 333
Roadmaking Plant—Spray Truck - ... .. 333
Agricultural Machinery—Tractors, Plough, Harvesters, etc.  33.3
Audition Unit—Station and testing equipment ... .. 33.3
Rigs (OiD) ... e .. 333
Roadmaking Plant—Jitney ... .. 333
CLASS D (WEAR AND TEAR) 40%
Aircraft—Engine Props—Rotable Spares ... .. 40

Aircraft—Second-hand ... .. 40",




Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994 481

(2) The Income Tax (Miscellaneous Clearance) Regulations are
amended—
(a) in regulation 2, by deleting the definitions of “Customs
Officer”, “Immigration Officer” and “Exit Certificate”;
(b) in regulation 3, by deleting subregulations (1), (2) and (3);
(¢) in regulation 4—
(i) in subregulation (1), by deleting the words “an
Exit Certificate or”;
(ii) in subregulation (2), by deleting the words “An
Exit Certificate or a Clearance Certificate” and
substituting the words “A Clearance Certificate”;
(d) by repealing regulations 5, 6, 7 and 9;
(e) in regulation 8—
(1) in subregulation (1), by deleting the words “an
Exit Certificate” and substituting the words “a
Clearance Certificate”;
(i) by deleting subregulation (3);
(f) by revoking regulation 10 and substituting the following
regulation:
“Appeal 10. A person aggrieved by—
(a) the refusal of the Board to grant him
a Clearance Certificate;

(b) the decision of the Board to revoke
his Clearance Certificate,
may appeal to the Appeal Board and the
decision of the Appeal Board is final.”.

6. The Corporation Tax Act is amended— Chep. 75,02
(a) in section 3A— amende

(i) in subsection (1), by deleting the words “0.25 per
cent” and substituting the words “0.5 per cent”;
(ii)) by repealing subsections (3) and (4) and
substituting the following subsection:
“ (3) A company is entitled to a tax credit
against its business levy liability for a year of
income of any payment made in respect of its
corporation tax liability for that year of
income up to a maximum of its business levy
liability.”;

(b) by repealing section 3B in relation to the incremental
profits tax;

(¢) in the Table under section 19, by inserting after the words
“Sections 10, 11” the words “,114, 11B”;

(d) in the First Schedule in relation to the rate of corporation
tax, by deleting the words “forty-five per cent” wherever
they occur in items 1 and 2 and substituting the words
“thirty-eight per cent”.

P.C.3




482 Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

Chap. 76:01 7. The Stamp Duty Act is amended in the First Schedule by
amended .
deleting—

(a) the heading “Customs entries in respect of imported goods”
and all the paragraphs under the heading ending with the
words “shall apply in the same manner as if the duty were
a duty of customs”;

(b) the Second, Third, Fourth and Fifth Schedules; and

(c) by inserting after paragraph (o) in the exemptions to the
entry “Customs entries in respect of imported goods” the
following paragraph:
“ (p) for the period December, 1994 and
subject to the relevant conditions stipulated in
section 45 and the Second Schedule to the

Chap. 78:01 Customs Act, motor vehicles, household effects
and personal effects imported into Trinidad and
Tobago by a returning national.”.

Chap. 77:01 8. The Miscellaneous Taxes Act is amended—
amended

(a) in section 35—
(i) in subsection (1), by inserting after the words
“at the rates” the words “in respect of the
period”;
(i) by inserting after subsection (6) the following
subsection:

{3

(7) Where a returning national imports
into Trinidad and Tobago a motor vehicle,
household effects or personal effects in
accordance with section 45 of the Customs Act
or the Second Schedule to the Customs Act,
import surcharge shall not be charged on the
entry of the goods imported.”;

(iii) by repealing subsections (4) and (7) with effect
from 1st January, 1995;

(b) by repealing section 36;

(c) in section 40—

(i) in subsection (1), by deleting the words “at the
end of each quarter ending on 31st March, 30th
June, 30th September and 31st December of each
year” and substituting the words “on or before the
fifteenth day of the month following the month in
which the tax was collected by the financial
institution.”;

(ii) by repealing subsections (3) and (4);




Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

483

(d) by inserting after Part X, the following Parts:

“PART XI
HoTEL ACCOMMODA’I‘ION Tax

Interpretation 50, In this Part—

“Appeal Board” means the Appeal
Board established wunder
section 3 of the Tax Appeal
Chap. 4:50 Board Act;

“assessment” means an assessment
under section 51(13)(a);

“Board of Inland Revenue” or
“Board” means the Board of
Inland Revenue established
under section 3 of the Income
Tax Act;

“company” means a body corporate
or an unincorporated associa-
tion, and includes a partner-
ship;

“hotel” means a building or group of
buildings occupied together
comprising not less than sixteen
bedrooms for the purpose of
providing hotel accommodation
for reward,;

“hotel accommodation”
means sleeping accommodation
and services and facilities
ancillary thereto provided in an
hotel for its guests not being
persons resident in the hotel
under a contract of service;

“hotel accommodation tax” or “room
tax” means the tax chargeable
in accordance with section
51(1)(a);

“hotel operator” means a person
who, either by himself or
through an agent or servant,
carries on the trade or business
of operating an hotel;

“person” includes a company.




484

Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

Hotel
accommoda-
tion tax

Chap. 85:02

51. (1) A tax to be called an hotel

accommodation tax shall be—

(a) charged on the proceeds of the
letting of hotel accommodation by
an hotel operator at the rate of ten
per cent of the proceeds of such
letting; and

(6) collected by an hotel operator.

(2) The Tax Authority shall be
the Board of Inland Revenue which,
in respect of the collection and
recovery of the tax, shall have all the
powers as it has in relation to income
tax under the Income Tax Act.

(3) Hotel accommodation tax is
payable notwithstanding that the
hotel is an approved hotel for the
purposes of the Hotel Development
Act, or is otherwise exempt from any
other taxes, charges, impositions or
levies by virtue of any other written
law.

(4) The room tax shall be
charged on the full amount of the
proceeds of the letting without any
other deduction or allowance than is
authorised or allowed by this section.

(5) An hotel operator is
accountable to the Tax Authority for
the tax and shall pay the tax to the
Tax Authority on or before the last
day of the month following that in
which the tax is collected.

(6) Where an hotel operator
fails to remit the tax in accordance
with subsection (5), the hotel operator
is liable for the payment of the
amount of the tax due, in addition to
interest on such amount at the rate of
fifteen per cent per annum from the
due date.

(7) An hotel operator shall
keep such books of accounts and
records as are required by the Tax
Authority.



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

485

(8) In computing the proceeds of
letting of hotel accommodation—

(a) no account shall be taken of room
tax recovered by an hotel operator
under subsection (11);

(b) no account shall be taken of
receipts in respect of any ancillary
services and facilities provided, if
the hotel operator receives no part
of the payment ascribable to such
services;

(c) there shall be allowed—

(i) bad debts, incurred in respect
of the letting, that are proved
to the satisfaction of the Tax
Authority to have become bad
during the period to which the
statement delivered to the Tax
Authority in accordance with
subsection (10) relates; and

(ii) doubtful debts to the extent that
each is estimated to the
satisfaction of the Tax Authority
to have become bad during such
period, even if such bad or
doubtful debts were due and
payable before that period
commenced, however, all sums
recovered at any time on
account of amounts previously
written-off or allowed in respect
of bad or doubtful debts shall be
treated as part of the proceeds
of the letting and brought into
account.

(9) Where tax becomes
chargeable, the hotel operator shall
account by means of the statement
referred to in subsection (10) and pay
over to the Tax Authority the room tax
at the rate specified in subsection (1).

(10) An hotel operator shall in
respect of each month deliver to the Tax
Authority a statement of the full amount
of the proceeds of the letting by him of



486

Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

all hotel accommodation and the amount
of the room tax payable thereon together
with such additional information as the
Tax Authority may require, in a form
approved by the Tax Authority, on or
before the fifteenth day of the next
succeeding month.

(11) In addition to the
requirements regarding the keeping of
accounts and other records provided for
by the Income Tax Act, an hotel operator
shall cause to be entered on every bill, a
receipt for which is given in accordance
with any other written law, the full
amount of the hotel accommodation tax,
specifying the rate of the tax that is
chargeable, and the hotel operator is
entitled to recover that amount from the
person to whom he has let the hotel
accommodation as if that amount were
part of the proceeds of the letting of the
hotel accommodation.

(12) A duplicate of every hotel
bill and the receipt therefor shall be kept
by every hotel operator so that it is
available at all times, and shall be
produced for inspection on demand by
the Tax Authority.

(13) Where an hotel operator has
failed to deliver a statement of the
proceeds of letting of hotel
accommodation as required by
subsection (10), then, after consideration
of any representation or information
which the hotel operator may make or
supply to it, the Tax Authority—

(a) shall assess the proceeds of letting
of the hotel accommodation for any
period and, subject to subsections
(17) and (18), room tax in relation
to that period shall be paid within
seven days from the day of service
on the hotel operator of the notice
of assessment of the amount so
assessed; and



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994 487

(b) may charge the hotel operator
additional room tax equal to treble
the amount of room tax which
would have been payable if this
paragraph had not been enacted,
unless the hotel operator satisfies
the Board that he ought fairly to be
excused.

(14) Where the Tax Authority is
satisfied that a true account of the
proceeds of letting of the hotel
accommodation has not been given in
the statement—

(a) because of the failure of the hotel
operator to keep the records and
books of account required or to
produce any records, books of
account or other documents or
information required to be
produced pursuant to the Income
Tax Act as applied by this Act; or

(b) because of any information
contained in any such records,
books of account of other
documents which the Board may
have obtained from any source,

then subsection (13), other than
paragraph (b) thereof, shall apply and if
the assessment results in the hotel
operator being charged with room tax in
excess of that shown in the statement,
the Tax Authority thay charge him, in
addition to the total room tax otherwise
charged in the assessment, further room
tax not exceeding the amount of room
tax charged in respect of the excess,
unless the hotel operator proves to the
Board’s satisfaction that the
incorrectness of the information in the
statement did not amount to fraud or
gross or wilful neglect.

(15) In making an assessment
under subsection (13), the Tax Authority
is not bound by the information
contained in any statement delivered by



488

Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

the hotel operator to which the
assessment relates or by other
information supplied by, or on behalf,
or in respect of, the hotel operator.

(16) Where an assessment is
made, the Board shall deliver a notice
of assessment to the hotel operator
showing the amount of proceeds of
letting of the hotel accommodation for
the period and the room tax payable
thereon, and advising him of his
rights under the Income Tax Act, as
applied by this Act.

(17) Where any hotel operator
disputes an assessment under
subsection (13) or (14), he shall
nevertheless, within the time limited
by subsection (13)(a), pay to the Tax
Authority the part of the room tax
stated in the notice to be payable by
him and any interest and any
penalties then remaining unpaid that
are not in dispute.

(18) An hotel operator who
disputes an assessment may, subject
to and in accordance with the Income
Tax Act relating thereto, object to the
assessment.

(19) An hotel operator who has
objected to an assessment and whose
objection has been disallowed by the
Board, may, subject to and in
accordance with -the Income Tax Act
relating thereto, appeal to the Appeal
Board from the decision of the Tax
Authority.

(20) For the avoidance of
doubt, it is hereby declared that in
ascertaining the chargeable income or
profits of a person for the purposes of
income tax or corporation tax, no
deduction or allowance shall be made
of, or on account of, the room tax
imposed by this section.



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

489

Special tax

Chap. 78:01

Definitions

Chap. 84:01

(21) Subject to this section, the
provisions of the Income Tax Act shall
apply in relation to room tax as they
apply in relation to income tax
chargeable under the Income Tax Act,
but subject to any necessary
modifications or adaptations.

PART XII
SeeciaL Tax

52. (1) A special tax shall be charged
on motor vehicles, household effects and
personal effects imported into Trinidad
and Tobago by a returning national in
accordance with section 45 of the
Customs Act or the Second Schedule to
the Customs Act, as the case may be, at
the following rates:

(a) in respect of motor vehicles, fifteen
per cent of the amount of the c.i.f.
value of the motor vehicle that is
in excess of T.T. $200,000;

(b) in respect of household effects and
personal effects, fifteen per cent of
the amount of the c.i.f. value of the
household effects and personal
effects that is, in the aggregate, in
excess of U.S. $100,000.

(2) The Tax Authority shall be the
Comptroller of Customs and Excise who,

in respect of the collection and

enforcement of the payment of the tax,
shall have all the powers that he has in
relation to customs duty under the
Customs Act.

PART XIIT
INSURANCE PREMIUM TAX

53. (1) In this Part —

“foreign insurer” means a company
incorporated outside of Trinidad
and Tobago which engages in
the insurance business and has
no established place of business
in Trinidad and Tobago;

“insurance business” has the
meaning assigned to it by
section 3 of the Insurance Act;



490

Prouvisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

“insurer” has the meaning assigned
to it by section 3 of the
Insurance Act and includes a
foreign insurer;

“premium” means any payment
or part payment received by
an insurer under a taxable
insurance contract,

" including any such payment
wholly or partly referable
to—

(a) any risk;

(b) costs of administration;

(c) commission;

(d) any facility for paying
in instalments, or
making deferred
payment (whether or
not payment for the
facility is called
interest); or

(e) tax;

“tax” means insurance premium
tax;

“Tax Authority” means the Board of
Inland Revenue;

“taxable insurance contract” means
any contract of insurance other
than—

(@) a contract relating to
ordinary long-term insur-
ance business as
defined in paragraph 1 of
the First Schedule to the
Insurance Act;

(b) a contract relating to
commercial ships or
aircraft;

(c) a contract relating to risks
outside of Trinidad and
Tobago;



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

491

(d) a contract relating only to
loss of, or damage to,
goods in foreign or
international tramnsit
which the insured enters
into in the course of a
business carried on by
him,;

(e) a contract of reinsurance.

(2) Where (apart from this
subsection) anything received under a
contract by the insurer would be taken
to be an instalment of a premium, it
shall be deemed to be a separate
premium.

(3) Where anything is received by
any person cn behalf of the insurer (in
this Part referred to as “an
intermediary”)—

(a) it shall be treated as
received by the insurer
when it is received by the
intermediary; and

(b) the later receipt of the
whole or any part of it by
the insurer shall be
disregarded.

(4) Where—

(a) a payment under a
taxable insurance contract
is made to an
intermediary; and

(b) the whole or part of the

payment is referable to

commission to which the
intermediary is entitled,

in determining for the purposes of
subsection (3) whether, or how much
of, the payment is received by the
intermediary on behalf of the
insurer, any of the payment that is
referable to that commission shall
be regarded as received by the
intermediary on behalf of the
insurer notwithstanding the
intermediary's entitlement.



492

Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994

Insurance
premium tax

Charge to tax

Chargeable
amount

Rate of tax

Liability to
pay tax

Payment of
insurance
premium tax

(5) Goods in foreign or
international transit are goods in transit
where their carriage—

(a) begins and ends outside
Trinidad and Tobago;

(b) begins outside but ends in
Trinidad and Tobago; or

(c) ends outside but begins in
Trinidad and Tobago.

54. (1) A tax, to be called insurance
premium tax, shall be charged in
accordance with this Part.

(2) The Tax shall be under the
care and management of the Tax
Authority.

55. Tax shall be charged on the
receipt of a premium by an insurer if the
premium is received—

(@) under a taxable insurance
contract; and
(b) on or after 1st January, 1995.

56. (1) Tax shall be charged by
reference to the chargeable amount.

(2) For the purposes of this Part,
the chargeable amount is such amount
as, with the addition of the tax
chargeable, is equal to the amount of the
premium.

57. Tax shall be charged at the rate of
six per cent.

58. (1) Tax shall be payable by the
person who is the insurer in relation to
the contract under which the premium is
received.

(2) Section 99(4) of the Income Tax
Act shall apply mutatis mutandis to a
person who fails to pay, or withhold, the
tax pursuant to section 59(1) or (2), as
the case may be.

59. (1) Subject to subsection (2), an
insurer shall, in respect of premiums
received by him or an intermediary in



Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1994 493

any month, pay the relevant tax
to the Tax Authority on or before
the fifteenth day of the following
month.

(2) Where a risk in Trinidad
and Tobago is insured by a foreign
insurer under a taxable insurance
contract, the insured person shall
withhold the tax payable in respect of
a premium under that contract and
pay it on behalf of the foreign insurer
to the Tax Authority on or before the
fifteenth day of the month after that
in which the premium is paid.

(3) Notwithstanding anything in
Chap.75:01 the Income Tax Act, the Corporation
Chap. 75:02 Tax Act or the Petroleum Taxes Act,
Chap.75:04 an insured person shall not, in
computing his chargeable income or
profits for the purposes of any of those
Acts, be allowed to claim a deduction
for the premium paid to the foreign
insurer unless the tax payable on that
premium is withheld and paid to the
Tax Authority.

Deemeddate  60. (1) Where—
of receipt of

certain (a) a premium under a contract of
premiums . . .
insurance is received by the
insurer after 1st December,
1994 and before 1st January,
1995; and
(b) the period of cover for the risk

begins on or after 1st
January, 1995,

the premium shall, for the purposes of
this Part, be deemed to be received on
1st January, 1995.”;

(e) by repealing the Seventh and Eighth Schedules and
substituting the following Schedule:




" SEVENTH SCHEDULE

FIRST COLUMN

TARIFF HEADING

NUMBEFR

SECOND COLUMN
DESCRIPTION

OF GOODS

RATES

1996

THIRD
' OF

1997

COLUMN
SURCHARGE

1998

02.01

02.02

02.04

Ex. 02.06

Meat of
bovine

~animals,

fresh or
chilled

Meat of
bovine
animals,
frozen

Meat of sheep
or goats,
fresh,
chilled or
frozen

Edible offal
of bovine
animals,
sheep, goats

10

10

10

10

4

v6¥

PE6I “4ap() SaxXD ], JO U01308]]00) [0UOISINOL



SEVENTH SCHEDULE

FIRST COLUMN

SECOND COLUMN

THIRD COLUMN
TARIFF HEADING DESCRIPTION RATES OF SURCHARGE
NUMBER OF GOODS 1995 1996 1997 1938 1999
Ex.0z.07 Chicken, not cut in pieces 20 15 10 5 0
(fresh, chilled or frozen)
Ex.04.01 Liquid milk (plain or 50 40 20 0 -
flavoured)
Ex.24.02 Liquid milk (plain or 50 49 20 0 -
flavoured)
9702.00 Tomatoes (fresh or chilled) 60 45 306 15 /]
B704.001 Cabbages (fresh or chilled) 60 45 30 15 0
0704.002 Cauliflowers (fresh or 60 45 30 15 /]
chilled)
0705.10 Lettuce (fresh or chilled) 60 45 30 15 ]
0803.001 Bananas (fresh) 20 15 19 5 ]
V803.002 Plantains (fresh) 20 15 10 5 @
Ex.08.04 Dates, figs, pineapples, 20 15 10 5 ]
avacados, guavas, mangoes
and mangosteens (fresh)

BE6T “1opa( saxv ] Jo 1013031100 1PU0IS1004]

S6¥



SEVENTH SCHEDULE

SECOND COLUMN THIRD COLUMN

FIRST COLUMN
TARIFF HEADING DESCRIPTION RATES OF SURCHARGE
NUMBER OF GO0DS 1995 1996 1997 1998 ) 1999
Ex.08.05 Citrus fruit (fresh) 20 15 19 5 2
0806.10 Grapes (fresh) 20 15 10 5 G
08.07 Melons (including 20 15 10 5 @
watermelons) and pawpaws '
(papayas) (fresh)
%}
08.08 Apples, pears and quinces 20 © 15 10 5
(fresh)
0809 .00 Apricots, cherries, 20 15 10 5 @
peaches, (including
nectarines), p<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>