
Legal Supplement Part B-VoL. 24, No. ll-lOth January, 1985 

LEGAL NOTICE No. 4 

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO 

THE PROVISIONAL COLLECTION OF TAXES ACT, CHAP. 74:01 

ORDER 

MADE BY THE PRESIDENT UNDER SECTION 3 OF THE 
PROVISIONAL COLLECTION OF TAXES ACT 

THE PROVISIONAL COLLECTION OF TAXES ORDER, 1985 

1. This Order may be cited as the Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, Citation 
1985. 

2. The Schedule to the Stamp Duty Act is amended-
(a) under the heading "Conveyance or transfer on sale of any SChedule to 

t " Chap. 76:01 
proper y - amended 

(i) by substituting for the words "exceeds one thousand 
five hundred dollars but does not exceed three hundled 
thousand dollars ... two per cent", the words "exceeds 
one thousand five hundred dollars but does not exceed 
three hundred and fifty thousand dollars ... 2.5 per 
cent."; and 

(ii) by substituting for the words "exceeds three hundred 
thousand dollars ... five per cent" occUl'ring immedi­
ately before the proviso, the words "exceeds three 
hundred and fifty thousand dollars ... 5 per cent."; 

(b) by inserting immediately after the words "and see section 39" 
occUl'ring. after the heading "Bill of Lading for goods, merchandise 
or effects to be exported", the following new heading-

"Customs entries in respect of 12 per cent of the 
imported goods other than- c,i.f. value of the 

(i) food; goods 
(ii) drugs; 

(iii) crude petroleum and petroleum feedstocks for 
processing in refineries in Trinidad and Tobago. 

In this heading-
"food" includes any article manufactured, sold or 

represented as food or drink for man but does 
not include alcoholic beverages; 

"drugs" has the meaning assigned to it by the Food Chap. 30:01 

and Drugs Act but does not include cosmetics 
within the meaning of that Act. 

7 



'.8 

Section 3(1) 
of 
Chap.76~04 
repealed and 
replaced' 

Chap. 79:50 
amended 

The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Stamp duty is payable to the Comptroller of Customs and 
Excise and notwithstanding any written law which requires 
stamp duty to be collected by meanS of embossed adhesive or 
impressed stamps, evidence of payment of stamp duty on that 
entry may be by way of a receipt issued and an endorsement 
relating thereto made upon the entry by the Comptroller of 
Customs and Excise. 

An entry on which stamp duty has been duly paid and 
evidenced as set out herein is deemed to be stamped and to 
satisfy the requirements relating to stamping under this 
Act.". 

3. Section 3(1) of the Lands and Building Taxes Act is repealed and 
replaced as follows-

;~:J~:e 3. (1) On all lands and buildings not being within the City 
:lands of Port-of-Spain or the Boroughs of San Fernando, Arima and 
buildings Point Fortin, there shall be raised, levied, collected and paid to 

the Comptroller of Accounts for the use of the State the following 
taxes-

(a) onland-
(i) up to a maximum acreage of 10 acres-an annual 

tax of $10.00 an acre or part thereof; 
(ii) in excess of 10 acres and up to a maximum of 

100 acres-an annual tax of $10.00 an acre on the 
first 10 acres and $15.00 on every acre or part 
thereof in excess of 10 acres; 

(iii) in excess of 100 acres-an annual tax of $10.00 
an acre on the fust 10 acres, $15.00 on every acre 
in excess of 10 acres up to a maximum of 100 acres 
and $20.00 on every acre or part thereof in excess of 
100 acres; and 

(b) on every building the annual taxable value of which 
does not exceed twenty-four dollars an annual tax of 
ninety-six cents; and on every building the annual 
taxable value of which exceeds twenty-four dollars, an 
annual tax of seven and one-half per cent of such 
taxable value. 

Buildings usually described as barracks containing separate 
tenements severally occupied, shall be taxed at the rate of 
ninety-six cents for each separate tenement, whether such 
buildings form part of any structUre for the manufacture or 
preparation of produce or not.". 

4. The Exchange Control Act is amended by inserting immediately after 
section 10 the following new section-

~iIa: or- lOA. (1) There shall be charged on the sale of foreign currency 
foreign for vacation or business travel or for effecting remittances to 
currency 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

persons who have left or are about to leave Trinidad and Tobago 
to reside permanently in another country, a tax of ten per cent 
of the purchase price of the foreign currency. 

(2) The tax shall be paid to the authorised dealer from 
whom the currency is being bought by the person buying the 
currency at the time of the sale and the authorised dealer shall 
forward the tax so collected to the Oentral Bank at the same 
time as returns in re,spect of foreign currency transactions are 
being made. 

(3) The Oentral Bank shall pay the tax to the Board 
of Inland Revenue to be credited to general revenue.". 

5. Section 17 of the Motor Launches Ordinance is am.ended- Section 17 
ofCh.lB. 
No.6 
amerided 

(a) by renumbering the section as section 17(1); and 
(b) by adding immediately thereafter the following new subsection­

AetNo.48 
of 1977 

"(2) Notwithstanding subsection (I), this Ordinance 
shall in respect of the fees and travelling expenses prescribed 
in the regulations apply to pleasure boats within the meaning 
of the Pleasure Boats Act.". 

6. The Motor Launches Regulations are amended- ~:~~es 
(a) by repealing and replacing regulation 10 as follows- =~~~ns 

"10. (I) The fee for an initial survey is $100.00 per 
launch and the fee for each annual survey after the initial 
survey is $50.00. 

(2) In addition to the survey fee the owner of a 
motor launch is required to pay to a Surveyor any reasonable 
travelling expenses incuned by the Surveyor in inspecting 
launches at a greater distance than one mile from the Harbour 
Master's Office but such expenses shall not exceed the rate 
set out in the Travelling Allowances Regulations in respect 
of the grade of vehicle used."; 

(b) byrepealiug and replacing regulation 20 as follows-
"20. The fee for examination of a certificate of com· 

petency as Oaptain or Engineer of a launch is $50.00 and 
the fee for the issue or renewal of a licence is $10.00."; 

(0) by amending the Schedule as follows-
(i) in Form B, by substituting for the words "Fee 24 cents" 

the words "Fee $100 for a motor launch under 7 m, $200 
for a motor launch 7 m-I5 m and $400 for a motor 
launch over 15 m"; 

(ii) in Form B, by substituting for the words "Fee-24 
cents" the words "Fee-$1O.00"; 

(iii) in Form D, by substituting for the words "Fee-24 
cents" the words "Fee-$1O.00" ; 



10 

Income Tax 
(Exit 
Clearance) 
Regulations 
G.N.No.132 
of 1971 
amended 

Chap. 20:10 
amended 

Cinemato­
graph 
Regulations 
amended 

The ProvisionaZ Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

(iv) in Form E, by substituting for the words "Fee-24 
cents" the words "Fee-$lO.OO"; 

(v) in Form F, by substituting for the words "Fee-24 cents" 
the words "Fee-$lO.OO". 

7. The Income Tax (Exit Clearance) Regulations are amended by inserting 
immediately after regulation 3(2) the following:-

"(3) A. person who applies for an Exit Certificate 
shall pay a fee of ten dollars in respect of the application." 

8. The Cinematograph A.ct is amended-
(a) by inserting immediately after the word "Cinematograph" 

occurring in section I the words "and Video Entertainment"; 
(b) by adding in section 2 in the appropriate sequence the following 

new definitions -
"video entertainment" includes any exhibition of pictures 

or other optical effects by means of video cassettes, 
tapes, discs or other similar material; 

"video proprietor" in relation to video entertainment means 
a person who rents video cassettes, tapes, discs or other 
similar material for video entertainment and includes 
a video club operator who charges a rental, membership, 
admission or subscription fee for the use of the club's 
video facilities or includes the person to whom payment 
is made for an interest which entitles a person to have 
access to or to use video cassettes, tapes, discs or other 
similar materials; 

"video and electronic games machines" means a machine 
used for playing a game which requires no action by 
any player other than the actuation or manipulation 
of the machine and includes any electronic apparatus 
which displays images or objects for the purpose of 
entertainment; 

"video and electronic games operator" means a person who 
operates an undertaking in which persons are entitled 
to use for a fee the video and electronic games machines 
on the premises.". 

9. The Cinematograph Regulations are amended-
(a) by inserting immediately after the word "Cinematograph" 

occurring in regulation I the words "and Video Entertainment"; 
(b) by adding in Part IV immediately after regulation 47 the following 

new regulation-
"Licences for 48. There shall be payable to the Board of Inland 
video proprietor 
and video and Revenue annually in. advance by a video proprietor or a 
electrOniC games video and electronic games operator in respect of a operators 

licence a fee of seven thousand five hundred dollars 
prior to the issue of that licence.". 



The Provisiona~ Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 11 

10. The Electricity (Inspection) (Amendment) Rules are amended 
substituting for Schedule B the following-

by G.N. No. 166 
of 1950 

Service8 

(a) Temporary Installations­
(i) Domestio 

(ii) Business or Industrial 
Installations 

(b) Permanent Installations­
(i) Servioe Mains ... 

(ii) Feeders and Sub-feeders 

(iii) Outlets 

(iv) Switohes 

(v) Motors 

(vi) Business or Industrial or 
Domestio Equipment other 
than Motors (e.g., Heaters, 
Welders, eto.) ... 

(0) Re-oonneotion and oondition 
Inspeotion-

(i) Domestio 

(ii) Busm.ess or Industrial 

(d) Inspeotion of Cables and oon· 
duits to be oovered or buried­

(i) Domestio 

(ii) Business or Industrial 

"SCHEDULE B 

In8peotion Fee8 Payable 

Single Phase or Three Phase '" 

Single Phase or Three Phase ... 

Single Phase 
Three Phase up to 100 Amps ... 
101 Amps-200 Amps 

$ o. 

30 00 

40 00 

20 00 
30 00 
40 00 

201 Amps-300 Amps 60 00 

Above 300 Amps 60 00 
plus $20.00 for every 100 Amps or part 
thereof in exoess of 300 Amps 

$5.00 per Feeder or Sub-feeder 

$1.00 eaoh 

$1.00 eaoh 

less that 1 horse power 5 00 

1-5 horse power 10 00 

over 5 up to 10 horse power 15 00 

over 10 horse power ... -... ..... 20 00 
plus $5.00 for every horse power in 
excess of 10 horse power 

$5.00 eaoh 

Single Phase 

Three Phase up to 200 Amps ... 

Over 200 Amps 

$5.00 per visit 

$10.00 per visit 

20 00 

40 00 

100 00 

20000 

L.N. No. 92 
of 1980 
L.N. No. 173 
of 1984 



12 The' Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

(6) Re.ins:pection­
(i) Domestic 

(ii) Business or Industrial Single Phase 

Three Phase up to 200 Amps ... 

Over 200 Amps 

20 00 

40 00 

100 00 

... 200 00". 

~:;da:d 10 11. The Second Schedule to the Liquor Licences Act is amended by sub· 
stituting therefor the following-

Spirit Retailer's Licenoe 

do. 

do. 

do. 

Wine Re.tailer's Licenoe 

do. 

do. 

Hotel Spirit Lioence 

do. 

do. 

"'do. 

Speoial Hotel Licence 

do. 

do. 

do. 

"SECOND SCHEDULE 

DUTIES 
Seotion 8, eto. (13 of 
1963, 2 of 1966, 45 of 
1979, 51/1980) 

For Port.of·Spain and with· $2,500 a year or, if per· 
in half a mile thereof mitted under seotion 15, 

$700 per quarter 

For San Fernando and $2,500 a year or, if per· 
within half a mile thereof mitted under section 15, 

$650 per quarter 

For any other Town and 
within half a mile thereof 
(exoept that portion of 
Morvant whioh lies with· 
in half a mile of Port·of· 
Spain) 

Elsewhere 

For Port·of·Spain 

For San Fernando 

Elsewhere 

$1,500 a year or, if per· 
mitted under section 15, 
$400 per quarter 

$800 a year or, if per· 
mitted under section 15, 
$200 per quarter 

$500 a year 

$500 a year 

$150 a year 

Hotels with up to 15 bed·· $1,000 a year 
rooms 

Hotels with 16 to 49 bed· $1,000 a year 
rooms 

Hotels with 50 to 150 bed· $1,000 a year 
rooms 

Hotels with more than 150 $1,200 a year 
bedrooms 

Hotels with up to 15 bed. $2,000 a year 
. rooms 

Hotels with 16 to 49 bed· $2,500 a year 
rooms 

Rotels- with 50 to 150 bed· $3,000 a year 
rooms 

Hotels with more than 150 $4,000 a year 
bedrooms 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Restaurant Licence 

do. 

do. 

Special Restaurant Licence 

do. 

do. 

Night Bar Licence 

do. 

do. 

Transfer fee under section 31 or 
section 32 

Occasional Licence under sec­
tion 40 or under section 44 

Spirit Grocer's Licence 

For Port-of-Spain 

For San Fernando 

Elsewhere 

For Port-of-Spain and with-
in half a mile thereof 

For San Fernando and 
within half a mile thereof 

Elsewhere 

For Port-of-Spain and with-
in half a mile thereof 

For San Fernando and 
within half a mile thereof 

Elsewhere 

For Port-of-Spain 

do. ... For San Fernando 

do. . .• Elsewhere 

Spirit Dealer's Licence 

Wine Merchant's Licence 

$1,500 a year 

$1,500 a year 

$1,000 a year 

$2,000 a year 

$2,000 a year 

$1,500 a year 

$3,000 a year 

$2,500 a year 

$2,000 a year 

$15 

$200 

$2,000 a year or, if per­
mitted under section 15, 
$550 per quarter 

$1,600 a year or, if per­
mitted under section 15, 
$500 per quarter 

$1,000 a year or, if per­
mitted under section 15, 
$300 per quarter 

$1,200 a year 

$300 a year.". 

13 

12. The Brewery Ordinance is amended in section 3(1) by substituting for Chap. 87:52 
.. . amended 

the words "twenty-five dollars" occurring in line two, the words "two thousand 
dollars". 

13. The Spirits and Spirit Compounds Act is amended in section 7(1) by Chap. 87:54 
amended 

substituting for the words "two hundred and fifty dollars" occurring in line 
five, the words "five hundred dollars". 



14 The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

~!~d:~:50 14. The First Sohedule to the Motor Vehicles and Road Traffio .Aot is 
amended-

(a) in item 4 by-

(i) substituting for sub item (a) the following-

"(4)(a) Private Motor Oars, Station Wagons .and 
Estate Oars 

HORSE POWER-R.A.I. RATING 

12 and Over 12 Over 20 Over 30 Over 40 Over 50 
Under 

Maximum Gross Weight S c. S c. S c. S c. $ c. $ c. 

Up to 1,599 lb .. 

1,600-2,099 lb. 

2,100-2,599 lb. 

2,600-3,099 lb. 

3,100-3,599 lb. 

3,600-4,099 lb. 

4,100 lb. and over 

... ... 67 50 105 00 142 50 240 00 360 00 490 00 

... ... 82 50 123 00 212 00 260 00 390 00 510 00 

... ... 105 00 142 50 240 00 290 00 410 00 540 00 

... ... 142 50 240 00 290 00 340 00 460 00 590 00 

... ... 240 00 290 00 340 00 390 00 510 00 640 00 

... ... 290 00 340 00 390 00 440 00 520 00 690 00 

... ... 340 00 390 00 440 00 490 00 610 00 740 00."; 

(ii) substituting for the figures appearing under the heading 
"ii Goods Vehicles" the following figures-

"GOODS VEmOLES 

Petrol Other than Petrol 

$ c. S c. 

67 50 307 50 

78 00 328 50 

9,0 00 349 50 

102 00 372 00 

11400 394 50 

132 00 424 50 

156 00 462 00 

187 50 508 50 

225 00 .. 56250 

262 50 619 50 

300 00 ·1i75 00 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Petrol 
337 50 
375 00 
412 50 
450 00 
487 50 
525 00 
562 50 
600 00 
637 50 
675 00 

712 50 
750 00 
787 50 
825 00 
862 50 
900 00 
937 50 
975 00 

GOODS VEmCLES 

Other than Petrol 

732 00 
787 50 
844 50 
900 00 
957 00 

1,012 50 
1,069 50 
1,125 00 
1,182 00 
1,234 50 

1,294 50 
1,350 00 
1,407 00 
1,462 50 
1,519 50 
1,575 00 
1,632 00 
1,687 50."; 

(b) by substituting for item (5)(b) the following­
"(5)(b) Rented Car 

(For each H.P.)-

Where the licence fee payable 
prior to lOth January, 1985 was 

(i) one hundred dollars or less $5.25 per H.P. 
RAC rating or 
part thereof 

(ii) over one hundred dollars $7.00 per H.P. 
RAC rating or 
part thereof" ; 

(c) by substituting for items (7) to (19) the following-

"(7.) Driving Permits 

(a) three year permit ... 
(b) one year permit 

(persons who have attained the age of 
sixty-five .. yeart> may renew their 
driving permit without charge) 

$100.00 
$15.00 

(8} M6torOmnibus conductor's Licence $5.00 

(9) Registration of Motor Vehicles or Trailer 
(inchiding certified extract) $20.00 

(10) Certified extract of entry in Register of Motor 
Vehicles other than on registration $10.00 

15 



16 

Chap. 48:50 
amended 

Ch. 31. No. 1 
as amended 
by G.N. 2/63 

The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

(II) Any duplicate or copy of a licence or permit 
authorised or required to be issued $10.00 

(12) Examination ofa driver under section 53 . $20.00 

(13) Oertificate of competency under section 53 $10.00 

(14) Annualinspection-

(a) ofatrailer ... $40.00 

(b) of a motor vehicle $40.00 

(15) Dealers licence ... $1,200.00 

(16) Duplicate of permit referred to in item (17) $10.00 

(17) Provisional permit $10.00."; 

(0) by adding immediately after item (17) the following new items-

"(18) Ohange of ownership $10.00 

(19) Amendments to register $10.00 

(20) Examination-study guides $1.00 

(21) Roadpermits ... $10.00.". 

15. Regulation IIl(3) ofthe Motor Vehicles and Road Traffic Regulations 
is amended by substituting for the words "two dollars" occurring in line 16 
thereof the words "ten dollars". 

16. The Oompanies Ordinance is amended­

(a) in section 286-

(i) by inserting immediately after the figures 286 occurring 
at the beginning of this section the figure(I); 

(ii) by introducing a new subsection (2) as follows: 

"(2) Where the nominal share capital of a company 
is increased the company shall cause a copy of the special 
resolution authorising the increase, to be filed with the 
Registrar, on payment of the fee specified in the Ninth 
Schedule." ; 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

(b) by substituting for the Ninth Sohedule the following-

":NINTH SCHEDULE 

TABLE OF FEES TO BE PAID TO THE REGISTRAR 

1. By a Oompany having a Share Oapital 

For registration of a company whose nominal share capital does 
not exceed $50,000 

For registration of a company whose nominal share capital exceeds 

$ c. 

200 00 

$50,000 200 00 
(plus $5.00 for every 
$10,000 or part thereof 
in excess of $50,000) 

For every increase of $10,000 or part thereof, in the nominal share 
capital subsequent to first registration 5 00 

(for every $10,000) 

For registration under Part III of the Ordinance any charge 
created by a Company or particulars of a series of debentures 
where the amount of the charge or the amount secured by the 
whole series-

exceeds 

does not exceed 

... $10,000 

... $10,000 

For registration of any document by this Ordinance required or 
authorised to be registered, or required to be delivered, sent 
or forwarded to the Registrar other than the memorandum 
or the abstract required to be delivered to the Registrar by 
a Receiver or Manager or the statement required to be sent 
to the Registrar by the Liquidator 

For making a record of any fact by the Ordinance required or 
authorised to be recorded by the Registrar 

II. By a Oompany not having a Share Oapital 

For registration of a company incorporated with the licence of 
the President under section 20 of the Ordinance ... 

For registration of any other company under this Part of the 
Schedule 

For registration under Part III of the Ordinance any charge 
created by a company or particulars of a series of debentures 
where the amount of the charge or the amount secured by the 
whole series:-

exceeds 

does not exceed 

... $10,000 

... $10,000 

For registration of any document by the Ordinance required or 
authorized to be registered or required to be delivered, sent 
or forwarded to the Registrar, other than the memorandum 
or the abstract required to be delivered to the Registrar by 
a Receiver or Manager or the Statement required to be sent 
to the Registrar by the Liquidator 

For making a record of any fact by the Ordinance required or 
authorised to be recorded by the Registrar 

100 00 

50 00 

20 00 

20 00 

300 00 

200 00 

100 00 

50 00 

20 00 

20 00 

17 



1$ The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

III. By a Oompany to which Part X of the Ordinance AppUes 

For registration of a certified copy of a Charter, statutes or memo­
randum and articles required to be delivered to the Registrar 
under Part X 

For registration of any other document required to be delivered to 
the Registrar under Part X 

IV. GeneraZ 

For inspecting the :file of documents kept by the Registrar in 
respect of each company 

Copy of any document per page 01' part thereof 

Any certificate of the Registrar 

$ c. 

1,000 00 

20 00 

20 00 

5 00 

20 00.". 

Chap. 82:85 fB N Rlil b amended 17. The Registration 0 _ usiness ames . es are amended by su stituting 
for Rule 9 the following-

"Fees 
2/1963 

21/1963 
45 of 1979 
51/1980 

9. The fees to be paid to the Registrar under the Act are-

(a) on a Statement of Particulars required by section 5 
of the Act,the sum of one hundred dollars; 

(b) on any Statement of Particulars required by the 
Schedule to the Act when such particulars are not 
furnished with the Statement of Particulars required 
by section 5 of the Act, the sum of twenty dollars; 

, (0) on a statement of any change within the meaning 
of section 8 of the Act, the sum of twenty dollars; 

(d) for inspecting, under the provisions of section 18 
of the Act, the documents filed by the Registrar, 
the sum of twenty dollars; 

(e) on the application of any person requiring under 
section 18 of the Act a certificate of registration 
of any firm, individual or corporation or a certified 
copy of or extract from any registered statement-

(a) certificate of registration 

(b) certified copy or extract 

$ c. 

20 00 

20 00 

(f) on appeal to the Minister from a decision of the 
Registrar, the. sum of one hundred dollars; 

and such fees as are payable under paragraphs (a), (b) and (0) shall cover the 
issue of one certificate of the registration of the statement.". 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 19 

. 18. The Second Schedule to the Patents and Designs Rules is deleted and Chap. 82:83 
. . amended 

the followmg substItuted therefor:-

"SECOND SCHEDULE 

FEES 

Patents 

On application for a patent. or extension thereof-

Foreign 

Local 

On application for provisional protection 

On registration for provisional protection 

On registration for every disclaimer amendment etc. as in section 7 

On registration of every assignment charge etc. under section 5(2} 

Foreign 

Local 

On application to correct any clerical error under section 46 

On inspection of any specification 

Designs 

On application for registration of every design ... 

On registration of every assignment, charge or transmission of a design 

An amendment of application under section 46(1) 

On application to correct any clerical error under section 46 

GeneraZ 

On every search or inspection of any of the registers 

Certifying the correctness of any document 

$ c. 

1,000 00 

300 00 

100 00 

100 00 

100 00 

100 00 

30 00 

100 00 

20 00 

100 00 

100 00 

20 00 

20 00 

20 00 

5000.". 

19. Section 4 of the Trade Marks Act, is amended by introducing a new Chap. 82:81 
. amended 

subsectIon (5) as follows:-

" (5) Fot the purposes of the fees specified in the First Schedule 
each mark in a series of marks is deemed to. be a mark that is separately 
registered. " 

20. The First Schedule to the Trade Marks Rules is amended by increasing Chap. 82: 81 

the fees stipulated in the second column thereof by one hundred per centum. amended 



20 

Schedule to 
G.N. No.5 
of 1968 as 
amended by 
L.N. No. 146 
of 1982 as 
further 
amended by 
L.N. No. 11 
of 1984 
repealed and 
replaced 

Chap. 77:01 
amended 

The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

21. The Schedule to the Excise Duty (Alcoholic Beverages) Order is repealed 
and replaced as follows-

"SCHEDULE 

FIRST COLUMN SEOOND COLUMN 

(a) Beer, Stout and Porter $1.05 per litre of wort at a specific gravity of 1050° 
and so in proportion for any difference in quantity 
of gravity; 

(b) Rum, Rum Punch ... $7.50 per litre at proof and so in proportion for any part 
of a litre or for any greater or less strength; 

(c) Gin 

(d) Blended whisky 

$15.00 per litre at proof and so in proportion for any 
part of a litre or for any greater or less strength; 

$15.00 per litre at proof and so in proportion for any 
part of a litre or for any greater or lesl:\ strength; 

(e) Cordials and Liqueurs $15.00 per litre at proof and so in proportion for any 
part of a litre or for any greater or less strength; 

(f) Other potable spirits 

(g) Vodka 

$15.00 per litre at proof and so in proportion for any 
part of a litre or for any greater or less strength; 

$15.00 per litre at proof and so in proportion for any 
part of a litre or for any greater or less strength." 

22. The Purchase, Sweepstake and Departure Taxes Act is amended:­
(a) by repealing the following items appearing in Part I of the First 

Schedule:-

Item 

"I-73.13 

1-73.13 

I-76.03 

1-76.03 

I-76.08 

I-22.02 

PART I 

First Oolumn 

Chargeable Goods 

Corrugated galvanized iron sheet· 
ing tBSWG22 to 26 guage mm 
thickness 0.711-0.457 

Flat galvanized iron sheets t DSWG 
20 to 28 guage mm thickness 
0.914--0.367 

Corrugated aluminium roof sheets 
tBSWG 20 to 22 guagemm 
thickness 0.914--0.717 

Flat aluminium sheets tBSWG 20 
to 22 guage mm thickness 0.914--
0.711 

Preformed aluminium roof sheets 
with baked enamel finish tBSWG 
20 to 22 guage mm thickness 
0.914--0.711 

Wines of the juices of grapes and 
vermouth 

Exemption: Wines used for the 
purpose of administering the 
Sacrament on the signed declara­
tion of the Head of the deno­
mination 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

10 

10 

10 

10 

10 

50 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Item 

I-22.03 
I-22.04 
I-22.05 
I-22.06 
I-22.07 
I-22.08 
1-22.09 
I-22.1 

I-22.11 
I-22.12 
I-22.13 

I-24.0l 
I-24.02 

P.Altr I-Oontinued 

First Oolumn 

Chargeable Goods 

Cider and Perry 
Beer and Ale ... 
Stout and Porter 
Rum in bottles ... 
Rum-other kinds 
Whisky and Blended Whisky 
Gin ... 
Cordials and Liqueurs, locally 

manufactured with ingredients 
produced from locally grown 
plants, fruits or other vege­
table materials 

Cordials and liqueurs-other 
Other potable spirits n.e.S. 
Flavouring and colouring extracts 

containing spirits 
Cigars, cheroots and snuff 
Locally manufactured cigarettes: 

(a) where the wholesale 
value does not exceed 
45 cents per pack of 20 

(b) where the wholesale 
value exceeds 45 cents 
per pack of 20 

and replacing them with the following: 

Item 

"I-73.13 

1-73.13 

I-76.03 
I-76.08 

I-76.03 
I-76.08 

I-22.05 

I-22.04 
I-22.03 

First Oolumn 

Chargeable Goods 

Corrugated galvanized iron and 
steel sheets ... 

Flat galvanized iron and steel 
sheets 

Corrugated aluminium sheets 
Aluminium sheets with baked 

enamel finish 
Flat aluminium sheets ... 
Preformed aluminium sheets with 

baked enamel finish ... 
Wines of the juices of grapes and 

vermouth 
Exemption.- Wines used for the 
purpose of administering the 
Sacrament on the signed declara-

~P.J1;}fu" of th, -::1 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

15 
15 
15 
30 
30 
50 
50 

30 
30 
50 

15 
60 cents per oz. 

20 cents per pack of 20 
and so in porportion 
when not so packed" 

25 cents per pack of 20 
and so in porportion 
when not so packed", 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

10 

10 
10 

10 
10 

10 

75 
23 
23 

21 



22 The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Item 

1..,.22.03 
1-22.09 
1-22.09 
1-22.09 
1-22.09 
1-22.09 

1-22.09 
1-22.09 
1-22.09 

1-24.02 
1'-24.02 

P.A:aT I-Oontinued 

First Oolumn 

Chargeable Goods 

Stout and Porter 
Rum in bottles 
Rum-other kinds 
Whisky and Blended Whisky 
Gin .. , 
Cordials and Liqueurs, locally 
manufactured with ingredients 
produced from locally grown 
plants, fruits or other vegetable 

materials 
Cordials and liqueurs-other 
Other potable spirits n.e.s. 
Flavouring and colouring extracts 

containing spirits 
Cigars, cheroots and snuff 
Locally manufactured cigarettes: 

(a) where the wholesale 
value does not exceed 
45 cents per pack of 20 

(b) where the wholesale 
value exceeds 45 cents 
per pack of 20 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

23 
45 
45 
75 
75 

45 
45 
75 

23 
90 cents per oz. 

30 cents per pack of 20 
and so in proportion 
when not so packed 

38 cents per pack of 20 
and so in proportion 
when not so packed" ; 

(b) by inserting after the last item appearing in Part I of the First 
Schedule the following items: 

Item 

I-OL011 
1-85.15 
1-39.01-
1-39.07 
1-84.15 

1-84.15 

1-48.15-
1-48.16 

First Ooliumn 

Chargeable Goods 

Horses 
Closed circuit television system 
All Plastic Products and Materials 
Exemption: Resin in all forms 
Ice Cream Conservators and re­

frigerated display units used on a 
commercial basis 

Refrigerators electrically operated 
domestic and other under 
1 Horse Power with a' cubic capa­
city of under 12 cubic feet 

P AJ"ERPRODUOTS: 
(a) Toilet paper 
(b) Box(ls, bags, other packing 
Qontl1m,ers of paper and 
paper board, box files,letter 
trays and similar articles 
of paper or paperboard of 
a kind commonly used in 
offices, shops and the like 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

50 
30 
10 

,30 

10 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Item 

1-48.21 

I-4S.21 

I_39.07} 1-44.27 
1-68.12 
1-68.16 
1-69.14 
1-70.14 
1-83.07 

1-97.04 
1-85.03 
1-22.09 

PART I-Oontinued 

First Oolumn 

Chargeable Goods 

(0) Trays, dishes, plates, cups 
and the like 

(d) Handkerchiefs, tissues and 
paper linen; and paper 
under-garments 

All lighting fittings and/or fix­
tures (fluorescent and others) ... 

Playing cards 
Primary cells and primary batteries 
Vodka 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

10 

10 

10 

10 
10 
75"; 

(c):by repealing the following items appearing in Part II of the First 
Schedule-

Item 

"II-73.13 

II-76.03 

II-76.0S 

II-22.02 

II-22.03 

First Oolumn 

Chargeable Goods 

Corrugated galvanized iron sheeting 
tBSWG 22 to 26 gauge rom 
thickness 0.711-0.457 

Flat galvanized iron sheets t BSWG 
20 to 28 gauge rom thickness 
0.914-0.367 

Corrugated aluminium roof sheets 
t BSWG 20 to 22 gauge rom 
thickness 0.914-0.717 

Flat aluminium sheets tBSWG 
20 to 22 gauge rom thickness 
0.914-0.711 

Preformed aluminium roof sheets 
with baked enamel finish t BSWG 
20 to 22 gauge rom thickness 
0.914-0.711 

Sparkling Wine (including Cham­
pagne) 

Wines of the juice of grapes and 
Vermouth except sparkling wine 
(including Champagne) 

Exemption: Wine used for the 
purpose of administering the 
Sacrament on the signed dec­
laration of the Head of the 
denomination 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

10 

10 

10 

10 

10 

50 

50 

23 



24 The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Item 

U-22.04 
II-22.05 
II-22.06 
II-22.07 
II-22.0S 
II-22.09 
II-22.10 
II-22.U 
II-22.12 
II-22.14 
II-22.15 

II-22.16 

II-22.17 

II-24.oI 
II-24.02 

II-24.03 
II-S4.02 

PART I-Oontinued 

First Oolumn 

Chargeable Goods 

Cider and Perry 
Beer and Ale 
Stout and Porter 
Other fermented cereal beverages 
Rum in bottles ... ... 
Rum other kinds 
Whisky and Blended Whisky 
Gin ... 
Brandy and Blended Brandy 
Cordials and Liqueurs other 
Fruit and Vegetable juices con­

taining spirits 
Flavouring and colouring extracts 

containing spirits 
Other potable spirits not elsewhere 

specified 
Cigars, Cheroots and snuff 
Cigarettes 

Tobacco (smoking and chewing) ... 
Freezers, electrically operated and 

other under 1 Horse Power 
Exemptions: Ice Cream conserva­

tors and refrigerated display 
units for use in commercial 
enterprises 

and replacing them with the following­
First Oolumn 

Item 

"II-73.13 

II-73.13 
II-73.03 
II-76.0S 

II-76.03 
II-76.0S 

II-22.05 

II-22.05 

Chargeable Goods 

Corrugated galvanized iron and 
steel sheets . 

Flat galvanized iron and steel sheets 
Corrugated aluminium sheets 
Aluminium sheets with baked 

enamel finish 
Flat aluminium sheets ... 
Preformed aluminium sheets, with 

baked enamel finish ... 
Sparkling Wine (including Cham­

pagne) 
Wines of the juice of grapes and 

Vermouth except sparkling wine 
(including Champagne) 
Exemption: Wine used for the 
purpose of administering the 
Sacrament on the signed de­
claration of the Head of the 
denomination 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

30 
30 
30 
30 
30 
30 
50 
50 
50 
50 

15 

15 

50 
60 cents per oz. 
25 cents per pack of 20 

and so in proportion 
when not so packed 

60 cents per oz. 

30" 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

10 
10 
10 

10 
10 

10 

75 

75 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Item 

TI-22.07 
TI-22.03 
TI-22.03 
TI-22.07 
TI-22.09 
TI-22.09 
TI-22.09 
TI-22.09 
TI-22.09 
TI-22.09 
TI-22.I5 

TI-22.09 

TI-22.09 

TI-24.02 
TI-24.02 

TI-24.03 
TI-84.I5 

PART I-Oontinued 

First Oolumn 

Chargeable Goods 

Oider and Perry 
Beer and Ale ... 
Stout and Porter 
Other fermented oereal beverages 
Rum in bottles 
Rum other kinds 
Whisky and Blended Whisky 
Gin ... 
Brandy and Blended Brandy 
Cordials and Liqueurs-other 
Fruit and Vegetable juioes oon· 

taining spirits ... 
Flavouring and oolouring extraots 

oontaining spirits 
Other potable spirits not elsewhere 

specified 
Cigars, oheroots and snuff 
Oigarettes 

Tobacoo (smoking and ohewing) ... 
Freezers, eleotrically operated and 

other under I Horse Power 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per cent 

45 
45 
45 
45 
45 
45 
75 
75 
75 
75 

23 

23 

75 
90 oents per oz. 
38 oents per paok of 

20 and so in pro­
portion when not so 
packed 

90 cents per oz. 

30"; 

(el) by inserting immediately after the last item appearing in Part II of 
the First Schedule the following-

Item 

"TI-OI-Oll 
TI-85.I5 
TI-39.01-

39.07 
TI-84.15 

TI-84.15 

TI-48.I5 
TI-48.I6 

First Oolumn 

Ohargeable Goods 

Horses 
Closed cirouit television system 
All Plastio Products and Materials 

Exemption: Resin in all forms 
Ioe Cream Oonservators and ref rig­

gerated display units used on a 
Oommeroial basis 

Refrigerator electrioally operated 
domestic and other under 1 HP 
with a oubio oapaoity of under 
12 ou ft. 

PAPER PRODUOTS: 
(al Toilet Paper 
(b) Boxes, Bags, other paok­

ing oontainers of paper 
and paperboard; box files, 
letter trays and similar 
articles of paper or paper­
board of a kind oommonly 

Second Oolumn 

Rate of 
Purchase Tax 

per oent 

50 
30 
10 

30 

30 

10 

25 



26 

G.N. No. 178 
of 1974 
G.N. No. 112 
of 1978 
amended 

The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

PART I-Oontinued 

First Oolumn Second Oolumn 

Item Chargeable Goods 
Rate of 

Purchase Tax 
per cent 

II-48.21 

II-4S.21 

II-39.07 
II--:44.27 
II-68.12 
II-68.16 
II-69.14 
II-70.14 
II-83.07 
II-97.04 
II-85.03 

II-22.09 

used in offices, shops and 
the like 

(0) Trays, dishes, plates, cups 
and the like . .. . .. 

(d) Handkerchiefs, tissues and 
paper linen; paper under­
garments 

All lighting fittings and/or fixtures 
(fluorescent and others) •.. 

Playing cards ... 
Primary cells and Primary 

batteries 
Vodka 

10 

10 

10 

10 

10 

10 
75"; 

(e) by repealing and replacing Part III of the First Schedule as 
follows-

Item 

22.03 
22.09 
22.09 
22.09 
22.09 
22.09 
22.09 
22.09 
22.05 
22.05-
22.06 

"PART ill 

Chargeable Goods 

Beer, Stout and Porter 
Rum 
Rum Punch 
Gin 
Whisky and Blended Whisky 
Vodka 
Cordials and Liqueurs 
Brandy and Blended Brandy 
Sparkling Wine (including Champagne) 
Wines of the juice of grapes and 

Vermouth 

$ c. 
1 05 

Rate per litre 

7 50atproof 
7 50atproof 

15 00 at proof 
15 00 at proof 
15 00 at proof 
15 00 at proof 
15 00 at proof 
5 50 

2 64". 

23. The Immigration Regulations are amended-

(a) by adding immediately after regulation 53 the following new 
regulation-

"Fees in 
respect of 
the issue 
of p'assports 
and other 
travel 
documents 

53A. Fees as shown in the Seventh Schedule in 
respect of the issue of passports and other travel or 
entry documents shall be collected by the Chief Immi­
gration Officer."; 



The ProvisionaL Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

(b) by repealing and replacing the Third Schedule as follows­

"THIRD SCHEDULE 

(Regulation 51) 

lMMIGRATION REGULATIONS 

Fee8 for Visiting and Olea·ring of Ship by Immigration Officer 

I. For visiting or clearing a ship between 4.00 p.m. to $100.00 for first 3 hours and 
8.00 a.m. on ordinary days of the week and on Saturdays, $50.00 per hour after, or 
Sundays and public holidays. part thereof. 

II. For any Immigration Service to vessels other than visit­
ing or clearing. 

Times and fees as at I 
above."; 

(c) by repealing and replacing the Fourth Schedule as follows­

"FOURTH SCHEDULE 

(Regulation 53) 

IMMIGRATION REGULATIONS 

Fees in respect of the Issue of Miscellaneous Permits and Oertijicate8 

I. For variations or extensions of Landing Certificate 
II. On application for the grant of Work Permit 

$ c. 
200 00 
200 00 

III. For the duration of Work Permit ... 200 00 per month subject 
however to a minimum of 
$400.00 

IV. Certificate for Facilitation.ofEntry: 
(a) for citizens or residents of Caribbean Free Trade 

Association Territories and of Caribbean Common 
Market Countries 

(b) for persons who are not citizens or residents 
referred to in (a) 

V. Certificate of Residence 
VI. Student's Permit 

VII. Application for Visa Waiver 
Vill. Change of Status 

100 00 

500 00 
200 00 
100 00 

50 00 
100 00"; 

(d) by repealing and replacing the Fifth Schedule as 
folliows-

"FIFTH SCHEDULE 

[Regulation 11(3)] 

IMMIGRATION REGULATIONS 

Fees in respect of the Issue of Licences to Travelling Salesmen 

The following fees shall be payable to the Comptroller of Accounts: 

In respect of the grant of the permission to a travelling salesman to engage in 
local business: . 

$ 
(1) Where the permission is expressed to be valid for a period of 

twelve (12) months ... ... ... ... ... 2,000 00 

c. 

(2) Where the permission is expressed to be valid for a period of six 
(6) months from the date on which it is granted ... . .. 1,000 00"; 

27 



28 The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

(e) by adding immediately after the Sixth Schedule the 
following new Schedule-

"SEVENTH SCHEDULE 

hIMIGRATION REGULATIONS 

Feea in reapect oj Travel Documents 

Travel Document8 

(a) Passports 

(i) Adult (Size A-32 pages) 
(ii) Child (under 16 years of age for five years renewable without 

charge after the first five years for full validity of ten years) 
(iii) Special (Size B-Iarger than size A in (i) above) 

(Regulation 53A) 

FeeB Payable 

$ c. 

50 00 
25 00 

150 00 
(b) Replacement of lost or mutilated passport 150 00 

(non refundable) 
(0) Travel Permit ... 
(d) Emergency Certificate 
(6) Certificate of Identity 
(1) Seaman's I.D .... 
(g) Endorsement 
(h) Affidavit in lieu of passport 
(i) Visa 

25 00 
25 00 

100 00 
50 00 
25 00 

100 00 
2500 .... 

G. N. No. 126 24. The Citizenship of the Republic of Trinidad and Tobago Regulations 
~~:ed are amended in the Second Schedule-

Chap. 15:01 
amended 

Post Office 
Regulations. 
Chap. 47:01 
amended 

(a) by substituting for the words "Grant of a Certificate of Registration 
under section 7 ... $240.00", the words-

"Certificate of Registration under section 7 
(i) Application for Certificate ... $50.00 

(ii) Where application is approved ... afurther $500.00,"; 

(b) by substituting for the words "Grant of a Certificate of Naturalisa­
tion under section 12 ... $240.00", the words-

"Certificate of Citizenship under section 12 
(i) Application for Certificate ... $50.00 

(ii) Where application is approved •.. a further $500.00". 

25. The Police Service Act is amended by inserting immediately after 
section 37 the following new section-

"Certificate 37 A. A person who applies to the police for a certificate of 
of character 

character shall pay to the officer in charge of the police station at 
which the application is made, an application fee of ten dollars 
which shall be credited to general revenue." . 

26. The Post Office Regulations are amended as follows-
(a) in regulation 12 by substituting for the words "five cents" 

occurring in line six thereof the words "twenty cents"; 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

(b) in regulation 13 by repealing and replacing subregulation (2) as 
follows-

"(2) There shall be charged and paid on air mail packets 
addressed to the countries in the various zones as set out in the 
Tenth Schedule, the rates of po~tage as set out in the Sixth 
Schedule." ; 

(0) in regulation 14 by substituting for the words "twenty cents" 
occurring in line four the words "forty cents" ; 

(a) in regulation 30 by deleting subregulation (4); 

(e) in regulation 32 by substituting for the words "fifteen cents" 
occurring in line two of subregulation (2), the words "thirty 
cents"; 

(f) in regulation 33-

(i) by deleting the words "and Post cards" occurring in 
line one; 

(ii) by deleting the words "Postcard impressed with a two 
cents stamp ... five cents each" occurring in lines six 
and seven; 

(g) in regulation 34-
(i) by substituting for the words "eighty cents" wherever 

they appear the words "one dollar and fifty cents"; 

(ii) by substituting for the words "ten cents" occurring in 
line four, the words "fifty cents"; 

(h) in regulation 37 by deleting the words "together with a further 
sum of two cents whichever is the less"; 

(i) in regulation 45-

(i) by substituting for the words "thirty cents" occurring 
in lines two and three of subregulation (1) the words 
"sixty cents" ; 

(ii) by substituting for the words "thirty cents" occurring 
in line six of subregulation (2) the words "sixty cents"; 

(j) in regulation 57 by substituting for the words "twenty five cents" 
occurring in line three of subregulation (2), the words "one 
dollar"; 

(k) in regulation 58 by substituting for the words "two hundred 
dollars" occurring in line one of subregulation (3), the words 
"five hundred dollars"; 

(1) in regulation 59 by repealing and replacing subregulation (1)(a) as 
follows-

29 



30 The Provisiona~ CoLlection of Taxes Order, 1985 

"(a) on every outgoting parcel a cash-on-delivery fee as 
follows-

For each $20.00 or fraction thereof of the trade 
charge ... 80 cents and a dispatch fee of ... 40 cents 

(b) on every incoming parcel a fee of ... $1.00"; 

(m) in regulation 78 by substituting for the words "forty cents" 
occurring in line two, the words "one dollar" ; 

(n) in regulation 82 by substituting for the words "thirty cents", 
"forty cents" and "fifty cents" wherever they occur in subregulation 
(2), the words "sixty cents", "eighty cents" and "one dollar" 
respectively; 

(0) in regulation 89 by substituting for the words "two hundred and 
forty dollars" occurring in line three of paragraph (b), the words 
"two thousand dollars" ; 

(p) in regulation 90 by substituting for the words "two hundred and 
forty dollars" wherever they occur the words "two thousand 
dollars" ; 

(q) by repealing and replacing regulation 93 as follows-
"Insurance 
offices 
G.N. No. 41 
of 1952 

Arima 
Arouca 

Belmont 
Blanchisseuse 

Oalifornia 
Oarapichaima 
Oarenage 
Oaroni 
Oedros 
Oentral Market 
Ohaguanas 

93. Letters and parcels will be accepted for 
insurance at and insured letters and parcels from abroad 
may be addressed to the following Post Offices only: 

EI Socorro Mayaro 
Erin Moriah-Tobago 

Moruga 
Forest Reserve Morvant 
Fyzabad 

Newtown 
Gasparillo 
George Street Oropouche 
Gonzales 
Gran Oouva Palo Seco 
Guaico Penal 
Guapo Point Fortin 
Guayaguayare Port-of-Spain 

Oharlotteville-Tobago Princes Town 
Olaxton Bay La Brea 
Oouva Laventille Rio Olaro 
Oumuto Roxborough-
Ounupia Manzanilla Tobago 
Ourepe Marabella 

Maraval Sangre Grande 
Diego Martin Matelot San Fernando 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

San Juan St. Vincent Street University of the 
Santa Flora West Indies 
Scarborough- Tabaquite 

Tobago Tableland Valsayn 
Siparia Taoarigua 
Speyside-Tobago Toco Williamsville 
St. James Tunapuna Woodbrook." ; 

(r) in regulation 113 by substituting for the words "five cents" 

oocurring in line four, the words "fifteen cents"; 

(8) in regulation 114 by repealing and replacing paragraph (b) as 

follows-

"(b) with effect from January, 

be-

1985 the annual rent shall 

Large boxes 

Medium boxes 

Small boxes 

$ c. 

100 00 
80 00 

50 00"; 

(t) in regulation 125 by substituting for the words "fifty dollars" 

and "five dollars" wherever they appear, the words "one hundred 

dollars" and "ten dollars" respectively; 

(u)in regulation 153 by substituting for the words "thirty cents" 

oocurring in line four the words "fifty cents"; 

(v) by repealing and replacing regulation 173 as follows-

~=o:ma- 173. Inland postal orders shall be issued for amounts 
inland postal 
orders of fifty cents, one dollar, two dollars, three dollars, four 

dollars, five dollars and ten dollars."; 

(w) by repealing and replacing regulation 174 as follows-
"Commission 
payable 
G;N. No. 160 
of 1975 

174. The sum of twenty oents shall be paid as a 

commission for each inland postal order issued up to and 

including the value of four dollars; where the value of 

-the order -eXceeds four dollars, the sum of fifty cents 

shall be paid as a oommission." ; 

(x) the Schedules to the Post Offioe Regulations are repealed and 

replaced as follows-



32 The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Country 

Anguilla '" 

Antigua ... 
Barbados ... 

Bermuda ... 
Dominica ... 
Dutch West Indies 

Grenada ... 
Guyana '" 

Jamaica ... 
Montserrat ... 
Nevis ... 
St. Kitts ... 
St. Lucia ... 
St. Vincent ... 

Tortola ... 

Canada 

"FIRST SCHEDULE 

PAROEL POSTAGE RATES FOR PAROELS SENT 

BY SU:&FAOE MAn. TO COMMONWEALTH 

AND FOREIGN COUNTRmS 

(Regulation 46) 
(41/1952 
192/1957 

20/1962 
130/1963 

... 

. .. 

... 

. .. 
'" 

'" 

. .. 

... 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 
'" 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

... 

... 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

. .. 

22/1967 
209/1968 
117/1971 
23/1972) 

Postage Rates for Parcels not exceeding 

2 lb. 7 lb. 11 lb. 22 lb. 

$ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. 

- - - -
- - - -
- - - -

- - - -
- - - -
- - - -
- - - -

1 50 2 00 2 50 3 00 

- - - -
- - - -

- - - -
- - - -
- - - -
- - - -

- - - -

... / For each pound or fraction of a pound up to a 
maximum of 22 lb., 55c. per pound 

The Postage rates on Parcels to all other countries shall consist of the 

terminal credits required by the country of destination or, in the case of parcels 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

sent in transit, the C.P.I. oredit required by the Transit Country, to whioh 
amount shall be added-

For paroels not exoeeding 2 lb. 

For paroelel exoeeding 2 lb. but not 7 lb. 

For paroels exoeeding 7 lb. but not 11 lb. 

For paroels exoeeding 11 lb. but not 22 lb. 

$ c. 

1 08 

1 36 
1 74 

2 48 

The final figures to be rounded up to amounts divisible by 5 oents. 

SECOND SCHEDULE 

(Regulation 89) 

Insurance Fees payable in addition to Normal Postage and Registration 

Fee 

$1.00 

$2.00 

$4.00 

$6.00 

$8.00 

$10.00 

$15.00 

$20.00 

Limit of Oompensation 

Up to $100.00 

Over $100.00 up to $200.00 

Over $200.00 up to $400.00 

Over $400.00 up to $600.00 

Over $600.00 up to $800.00 

Over $800.00 up to $1,000.00 

Over $1,000.00 up to $1,500.00 

Over $1,500.00 up to $2,000.00 

THIRD SCHEDULE 
(Regulation 129) 

List of Post Offices at which Inland and Foreign Money Orders are issued and paid: 

Arima Forest Reserve Oropouche 
Arouca Fyzabad 

PaloSeco 
Belmont Gaspa.rillo Penal 
Blanchisseuse George Street Pt. Fortin 
California Gonzales Place Princes Town 
Carapichaima GranCouva 

Guaico Rio Claro 
Carenage 

Guapo Caroni Sangre Grande 
Central Market Guayaguayare Santa Flora 
Cedros La Brea SanJuan 
Chaguanas Laventille Siparia 
Claxton Bay Manzanilla St. James 
Couva Marabella St. Vincent Street 
Cunupia Maraval Tabaquite Cumuto Matelot Tableland Curepe Moruga Tacarigua 
Diego Martin Mayaro Toco 
EISocorro Morvant Tunapuna 
Erin NewTown 

33 



34 The Provisional Collection O'f Taxes Order, 1985 

University of the 
West Indies, 

VaIsayn 

Williamsville 
Woodbrook 

San Fernando 

G. P. O.-Port-of­
Spain 

FOURTH SCHEDULE 

Tobago 
Charlotteville 
Moriah 
Roxborough 
Speyside 
Scarborough 

(Regulation 130) 

RATES OF COMMISSION PAYABLE ON INLAND AND FOREIGN MONEY ORDERS: 

Inland Money OrdeJl's 

For any sum not exceeding $50.00 
For each additional $50.00 or part thereof not exceeding $200.00 
For each additional $100.00 or part thereof up to $500.00 

$ c. 

1 25 
75 
50 

A single Money Order shall not be issued for any sum in excess of five hundred dollars. 

Foreign Money Orders 

$ c. 

For any sum not exceeding $20.00 1 00 
For each additional $10.00 or part thereof 20 
A single Money Order shall not be issued for any sum in excess of two hundred and forty 

dollars. 

FIFTH SCHEDULE 

(Regulation 172) 

LIST OF POST OFFICES IN TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO AT WHIOH INLAND AND BRITISH POSTAL 

ORDERS ARE IsSUED AND PAID 

Arimo. 
Arouca 
Belmont 
Blanchisseuse 
California 
Carapichaima 
Carenage 
Caroni 
Central Market 
Cedros 
Chaguanas 
Claxton Bay 
Couva 
Cumuto· 
Cunupia 
Curepe 
Diego Martin 
EISocorro 
Forest Reserve 
Fyzabad 
Gasparillo 
George Street 

Gonzales Place 
GranCouva 
Guaico 
Guapo 
Guayaguayare 
La Brea 
Laventille 
Manzanilla 
Marabella 
Maraval 
Matelot 
Mayaro 
Moruga 
Morvant 
Newtown 
Oropouche 
PaloSeco 
Penal 
G. P. O.-Port-of­

Spain 
Point Fortin 
Princes Town 

Rio Claro 
San Fernando 
Sangre Grande 
SanJuan 
Siparia 
St. James 
St. Vincent Street 
Tabaquite 
Tableland 
Tacarigua 
Toco 
Tunapuna 

University of the 
West Indies 

Valsayn 
Williamsville 

Tobago 
Scarborough 
Moriah 
Charlotteville 
Roxborough 
Speyside 



The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

SIXTH SCHEDULE 
[Regulation 13(2)] 

Am MAIL RATES 

Each 10 g Each 10 g 
Letters .Air Mail Net over or part Net over or part 

Zone 10 g thereafter 20 g thereafter 

$ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. 

A 65 45 

B 80 60 

a 95 75 

D 1 10 85 

E I 30 1 05 

Printed Papers and Small A 55 25 
Packets 

B 65 30 

C 85 40 

D 1 05 50 

E 1 15 55 

Postcards ... ... A 55 

B 70 

C 80 

D 90 

E 100 

Aerogrammes .Air Letter Forms 

To the Commonwealth Caribbean ......... 55c. 

To all other Countries ........................ 70c. 

READY REOKONER 0]' Am MAIL RATES 

LETTERS II 
PRINTED P Al'ERS 
SMALL PAOKETS 

ZONE A B C D E A B C D E 

Net Over $ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. 

10 g ... 65 80 95 1 10 1 30 

20 g ... 1 10 1 40 I 70 1 95 2 35 55 65 85 105 115 

30 g ... 1 55 2 00 2 45 2 80 3 40 80 95 1 25 1 55 170 

40 g ... 2 00 2 60 3 20 3 65 4 45 1 05 1 25 1 65 2 05 2 25 

35 



36 The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

Zone A 

Net Over $ c. 

50 g ... 245 

60 g ... 2 90 

70 g ... 3 35 

80 g ... 3 80 

90 g ... 425 

100 g ... 470 

1l0g ... 5 15 

120 g ... 560 

130 g ... 605 

140 g ... 6 50 

150 g ... 6 95 

160 g ... 740 

170 g ... 7 85 

180 g ... 8 30 

190 g ... 8 75 

200 g ... 9 20 

Weight above ... 45 
200 g 

SIXTH SCHEDULE-CONTINUED 
READY REOKONEB. OF Am MAIL RATES 

LETTERS 

B C D E 

$ c. $ c. $ c. $ c. 

3 20 3 95 4 50 5 50 

3 80 4 70 5 35 6 55 

4 40 5 45 6 20 7 60 

5 00 6 20 7 05 8 65 

5 60 6 95 7 90 9 70 

6 20 7 70 8 75 10 75 

6 80 8 45 9 60 11 80 

7 40 9 20 10 45 12 85 

8 00 9 95 11 30 13 90 

8 60 10 70 12 15 14 95 

9 20 11 45 13 00 16 00 

9 80 12 20 13 85 17 05 

10 40 12 95 14 70 18 10 

11 00 13 70 15 55 19 15 

II 60 14 45 16 40 20 20 

12 20 15 20 17 25 21 25 

60 75 85 1 05 
per additional 10 g 

II 
A 

$ c. 

1 30 

1 55 

1 80 

2 05 

2 30 

2 55 

2 80 

3 05 

3 30 

3 55 

3 80 

4 05 

430 

4 55 

4 80 

5 05 

25 

PRINTED P AI'ERS 
SMALL PAOKETS 

B C D 

$ c. $ c. $ c. 

1 55 2 05 2 55 

1 85 2 45 3 05 

2 15 2 85 3 55 

2 45 3 25 4 05 

2 75 3 65 4 55 

3 05 4 05 5 05 

3 35 4 45 5 55 

3 65 4 85 6 05 

3 95 5 25 6 55 

4 25 5 65 7 05 

4 55 6 05 7 55 

4 85 6 45 8 05 

5 15 6 85 8 55 

5 45 7 25 9 05 

5 75 7 65 9 55 

6 05 8 05 10 05 

30 40 50 
per additional 10 g 

SEVENTH SCHEDULE 

E 

$ c. 

2 80 

3 35 

3 90 

4 45 

5 00 

5 55 

6 10 

6 65 

7 20 

7 75 

8 30 

8 85 

9 40 

9 95 

10 50 

11 05 

55 

(Regulation 47) 
INTERNATIONAL Am P AROEL SERVIOES 

Air 8urcharge, to be added to appropriate surface parcel postage rates 

Antigua 
Barbados 
Bermuda 
Guyana 
Canada 
Aruba and Curacao 
Grenada 
Jamaica 
St. Kitts 
St. Lucia 
Great Britain 

Destination Air Surcharge 
10 cents per t lb. 
5 cents per t lb. 

50 cents per t lb. 
10 cents per t lb. 
70 cents per lIb. 
15 cents per t lb. 
5 cents per t lb. 

30 cents per t lb. 
15 cents per t lb. 

United States of America 

10 cents per t lb. 
$1.30 cents per t lb. 

65 cents per t lb. 



The Provisional CoLlection of Taxes Order, 1985 

EIGHTH SOHEDULE 

POSTAGE RATES PAYABLE ON INLAND MAIL ITEMS 

(Other than Parcel8) 

LETTERS 

For the first 20 grammes or part thereof 

For each additional 50 grammes or part thereof 

POSTCARDS, PRINTED PAPERS 

For the first 50 grammes or part thereof 

For each additional 50 grammes or part thereof 

SMALL PAOKETS 

For the first 100 grammes or part thereof 

Over 100 grammes up to 250 grammes 

Over 250 grammes up to 500 grammes 

Over 500 grammes up to 1 kilo gramme 

ARTICLES FOR THE BLIND 

No charge 

NINTH SCHEDULE 

POSTAGE RATES PAYABLE ON POSTAL PAOKETS 
(other than pa1'cels) Jor overseas delivery,' 

FOI' delivery to Oommonwealth Oaribbean Oountries 

For the first 20 grammes or part thereof 

Over 20 grammes up to 50 grammes 

Over 50 grammes up to 100 grammes 

Over 100 grammes up to 250 grammes 

Over 250 grammes up to 500 grammes 

Over 500 grammes up to 1 kilo gramme 

Over 1 kilogramme up to 2 kilogrammes 

For delivery to othet' Foreign Oountries 

For the first 20 grammes or part thereof 

Over 20 grammes up to 50 grammes 

Over 50 grammes up to 100 grammes 

Over 100 grammes up to 250 grammes 

Over 250 grammes up to 500 grammes 

Over 500 grammes up to 1 kilogramme 

Over 1 kilogramme up to 2 kilogrammes 

For aU Foreign Oount~'ie8 
Postcards 

LETTERS 

LETTERS 

(Regulation 11) 

30 
20 

20 
10 

30 
50 
95 

1 25 

[Regulation 13(1)] 

$ c, 
50 
80 

I 20 
2 50 
4 50 
7 50 

10. 00 

$ c. 
65 

1 00 
1 50 
B 00 
5 90 

10 00 
14 00 

45 

37 



Q8 The Provisional CoUection of Taxes Order, 1985 

l'mNTED MAT.cER 

For the first 20 grammes or part thereof 
$ c. 

30 

Over 20 grammes up to 50 grammes 

Over 50 grammes up to 100 grammes 

Over 100 grammes up to 250 grammes 

Over 250 grammes up to 500 grammes 

Over 500 grammes up to 1 kilogramme 

Over 1 kilogramme up to 2 kilogrammes 

Each additional 1 kilogramme or part thereof 

50 

70 

1 20 

2 10 

3 50 

5 00 

2 50 

SMALL PAOKETS 

For the first 100grammes or part thereof 80 

1 20 

2 10 

3 50 

Over 100 grammes up to 250 grammes 

Over 250 grammes up to 500 grammes 

Over 500 grammes up to 1 kilogramme 

TENTH SOHEDULE 

.Am MAl:L ZONES 
[Regulation 13(2)] 

Oountr'll Zone 

Abu Dhabi (see United Arab 
Emirates) 

Afghanistan D 
Ajman (see United Arab Emi· 

rates) 
Algeria D 
Angola (Peoples Rep. of) D 
Anguilla A 
Antigua A 
Argentina D 
Arliba (see Netherlands Antilles) 
Ascension E 
Australia E 
Azores 0 
Bahamas B 
Bahrain (State of) D 
Bangladesh ... E 
Barbados A 
Belize B 
Benin (Peoples Rep. of) D 
Bermuda B 
Bhutan E 
Bolivia 0 
Bonaire (see Netherlands Antilles) 
Botswana E 
Brazil 0 
British Indian Ocean Territories D 
British Virgin Islands (Tortola) B 
Brunei E 
Burma E 
Burundi E 

Oountr'll Zone 

Oambodia (see Kampuchea) 
Oameroon E 
Oanada 0 
Oanary Islands 0 
Oape Verde ... D 
Oayman Islands A 
Oaroline Islands D 
Oentral African Republic D 
Chad (Rep. of) E 
Chile D 
China (People's Rep. of) E 
Ohristmas .Island {Indian Ocean)E 
Oocos (Keeling) Islands E 
Oolombia 0 
Oomoros (Rep. of) E 
Oongo (Peoples Rep. of) E 
Oook (or Hervey) IslandsE 
Oosta Rica 0 
Ouba 0 
Curacao (see.N etherlandsAntilles) 
Cyprus D 
Dahomey (see Benin) 
Doha (see Qatar) 
Djibouti E 
Dominica A 
Dominican-Republic B 
Dubai (see United Arab Emirates) 
East Timor E 
Equador 0 
Egypt (Arab Rep. of) D 
EI Salvador ... 0 



,~~~, I;lCHEPUl'.E=Co:tq'mtQ':;~p 

'4m~,Z~$ 
[Regulation 13(2)] 

Oountry' Zone 

Equatorial Guinea (Rep. of) E 
Eritrea (866 Ethiopia) 
Ethiopia ... .E' 
Eqropean Countries •.. D' 
F~lkland IslandS & Dependencies D 
F!J,.roe Islands .• '.' D ' 
Fiji ., E 
FormosB(8eeTaiwan) 
French Guiana B 
French Polynesia E 
French West Indies ..• B 
Friendly Islands (S66 Tonga) 
Fumllirah (86e United Arab 

Emirates) ... 
Gabon (Rep. of) E 
Galapagos Islands (81111 Ecuador) 
Gambia (Rep. of) E 
Gaza and Khan Yunis E 
Ghana E 
Gibraltar D 
Gilbert Islands E. 
Great Britain and Northem 

Ireland C 
Grenada A 
Guadeloupe (8ee Fr. West Indies) 
Guam' E 
Guatemala C 
Guinea (Rep. of) E 
Guinea Bissau (Rep. of) E 
Guyana .•• ..• A 

Haiti B 
Honduras Republic C 
HongKong ... E 

India D 
Indone~a E 
Iran D 
Iraq D 
Irish Republic C 
Israel D 
Ivory Coast (Rep. of) E 
Jamaica A 
Japan E 
Jordan D 
Kampuchea E 
Kenya E 
Korea-Peoples Republic of... E 
Kuwait 
Lao-Peoples Democratic Rep. •.• E 
Lebanon ... ... . .. D 
Lesotho E 
Liberia (Rep. of) E 
Libyan Jamahiriya D 
Macao E 
Madeira D 
Madagascar E 
Malawi E 
Malaysia E 
Maldives (Rep. of) E 
Mali ... E 

Oountry Zone 

Malta D 
Mai'iana. Islands ... E 
Ma:rquElsa Islands (8ee French 

l'ulynesia) ... • •• 
Ml!i'shall Islands :.. E 
Martllilque, '(s!le':Fr. West l;lldies) 
Mauritania E 
l\Hiurltius ,'F' E 
Mexico ... C 
Mongolia-Peoples Rep. of E 
Montserrat ••• ... A 
Murocco D 
:Mozambique •.• E 
lVlu.,eul (8ee Oman) E 
Namibia Island E 
Nauru 
Nepal E 
Netherlands Antilles ' B 
Nevis (see St. Kitts) 
New Caledonia ... E 
New Guinea (sse.Papua), E 
New Hebrides ... E' 
New Zealand... ... E 
New Zealand Island Territories... E 
Nicarigua C 
Nigeria (Fed. Rep. of) 
Niger Rep....... E 
Norfolk Hland E 
Oman (Sultanate of) D 
Pakistan D 
Panama-Rep. of C 
Papua New Guinea D 
Paraguay D 
Peru C 
Philippines E 
Pitcairn Island E 
Puerto Rico ... B 
Qatar (State of) E 
Ras Al Kaiman (see United Arab 

Emirates) ... 
Reunion ... E 
Rio Muni (8ee Equatorial Guinea) 
Rwanda ... ... ... E 
Sabah E 
St. Eustatius (see Netherlands 

Antilles) 
St. Helena E 
St. Kitts-Nevis A 
St. Lucia ... A 
St. Maarten (or Martin) 

(see Netherlands Antilles) 
St. Pierre and Miy uelun 
St. Vincent ... A 
Samoa (U.S. Territory) E 
Sao Tome and Pnncipe E 
Sarawak E 
Saudi Arabia... D 
Senegal (Bep. of) E 
Seychelles ... ... E 
Sharjah (see United Arab Emirates) 



40 

Commence­
ment 

The Provisional Collection of Taxes Order, 1985 

"TENTH SCHEDuLE-CoNTINUED 

Am MAIL ZONES 
[Regulation 13(2)] 

Oountry Zon6 Oountry Zon6 

Sierra Leone ... E 
Singapore (Rep. of) E 
Solomon Islands E 

Uganda E 
Umm Said (8ee Qatar) ..• 
U.S.S.R. D 

Somali Dem. Rep. E 
South Africa ... E 

United Arab Emirates... C 
United States of America D· 

Spanish Territories ofN. Africa ... 
Sri Lanka D-
Sudan Dem. Rep. E 
S~n~ B 
Swaziland E 
Syrian Arab Republic ... D 

Upper Volta ... D 
Uruguay D 
Umm al Qaiwan (866 United Arab 

Emirates) 
Vatican 
Venezuela B 

Taiwan (Formosa) D 
Tanzania E 
Thailand E 
Togo (Rep. of) E 
Tonga ... ... E 
Tortola (866 Brit. Virgin Islands) 
Tristan da Cunha E 

Viet Nam E 
Virgin Islands (U.S.) B 
Wake Island E 
Western Samda E 
Yemen Arab Republic D 
Yemen People's Dem. Rep. D 

Tunisia D 
Turks and Caicos B 
Tuvalu E 

Zaire (Rep. of) E 
Zimbabwe E 
Zambia E" 

27. This Order comes into operation on the 10th day of January, 1985. 

Dated this 9th day of January, 1985. 

K. BOSWELL INNISS 
Secretary to Cabinet 


