
Legal Supplement Part B to the "Trinidad and Tobago Gazette", Vol. 19, No. 241, S29 
28th July, 1980 

LEGAL NoTICE No. 51 

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO 

THE LAw REVIsioN AcT, 1979 

NOTICE 

ISSUED BY THE PRESIDENT UNDER PARAGRAPH 4 OF THE SECOND SCHEDULE 
TOTHELAWREvrsroN AcT, 1979 

NoTICE is hereby given that the President approves that in the first revision 
of the Laws under the I"aw Revision Act, 1979 the Law Revision Commission 
may (by virtue of the powers conferred on it by section 23 of the Law Revision 
Act, 1979 and paragraph 4 of the Second Schedule to the said Act), amend the 
written laws set out in the first column of the Schedule by increasing monetary 
sums prescribed therein in the manner specified in the second column of the 
Schedule. 

LAw TO BE AMENDED 

Petty Civil Courts Ordinance, 
Ch. 3.No. 3 
Section 28 

Section 43(1) 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Petty Civil Court Rules 

(1950Ed. Vol. Vlllp. 37) 
Rule 5(2) 

Rule 32 

Schedule 
(under Rule 49) 
Fees 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For the words "twelve cents" substitute 
"one dollar". 

For the words "twenty.four" substitute 
"two hundred". 

For "72 cents" substitute "one dollar and 
fifty cents". 

Item (a) For "$10" substitute "$20". 
For "$7" substitute "$15". 
For "$5" substitute "$10". 
For "$2.50" substitute "$5". 

Item (b) For "$10" substitute "$20". 
Item (c) For "$5" substitute "$10". 

For each sum in the first column below (under 
the respective headings) substitute the sum 
opposite to it in the second column: 

In Actions for $50 and Under 
$ c. $ c. 

48 I 00 
48 1 00 
24 50 
24 50 
24 50 
48 1 00 
24 50 
24 50 
24 50 



530 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Petty Civil Courts Rules, 
Ch. 3. No.3 
Fees-Oontd. 

Notice 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

In Actions for Over $50 and up to $120 
$ c. $ c. 
1 20 2 00 

48 1 00 
24 50 
96 1 50 
24 50 
48 1 00 
24 50 
24 50 
48 1 00 
48 1 00 
24 50 

In Actions over $120 or for the Recovery 
of Land or for the Delivery of Specific 
Goods 

$ c. $ c. 
l 80 3 00 

$ c. 
48 
24 

1 20 
60 

GENERAL 

$ c. 
1 00 

50 
2 00 
1 00 

SOLICITORS' FEES 

In Actions for amounts not exceeding $50 
$ c. $ c. 
2 00 5 00 
3 60 7 50 
5 04 10 00 
5 04 10 00 

10 08 20 00 
12 00 25 00 
15 00 30 00 
14 40 30 00 
24 00 50 00 

5 04 10 00 
7 20 15 00 

p ARTIOULARS 

$ c. $ c. 
24 100 

ATTACHMENT OF DEBTS 

$ c. 
3 60 
7 20 

10 00 

$ c. 
7 5o 

15 00 
20 00 

GARNISHEE'S SOLICITORS COSTS 

$ c. $ c. 
2 40 5 00 

ON IssUING EXECUTION 

$ c. $ c. 
1 20 2 00 
3 00 7 50 



LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Petty Civil Courts Rules, 
Ch. 3.No. 3 
Fees-Gontd. 

Summary Courts Ordinance, 
Ch. 3.No. 4 
Section 68(2) 

Section 74(1) 

First Schedule 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Summary Courts (Costs on Appeal) Rules 

(G.N.175f58) 
Schedule 

Item !-Registrar (a) 
Item !-Registrar (b) 
Item !-Registrar (c) 
Item !-Registrar (d) 
Item !-Registrar (e) 
Item 2-Counsel (a) 

Item 2-Counsel (b) 

Item 3-Solicitors (a) 
Item 3-Solicitors (b) 

Item 3-Solicitors (c) 
Item 3-Solicitors (d) 
Item 3-Solicitors (e) 

Item 3-Solicitors {f) 
Item 3-Solicitors (g) 
Item 3-Solicitors (h) 

Summary Offences Ordinance, 
Ch. 4.No.17 
Section 24 

Section 99(2) 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Detention of Animals (Scale of Charges) 

Regulations 
(1950Ed. Vol. VIIIp. 62) 

Regulation 2 

Notice 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

$ c. 
25 20 
50 40 

CoUNSEL's FEES 

$ c. 
50 00 

100 00 

For "one hundred and fifty dollars" substitute 
"one thousand dollars". 

For "twenty-four dollars" substitute "two 
hundred dollars". 

For "72 cents" substitute "$5.00". 
For "96 cents" substitute "$1.00". 
For "24 cents" substitute "$0.50". 

For ".48" substitute "$2.00". 
For "$1.20" substitute "$3.00". 
For ".24" substitute "$1.00". 
For" .12" substitute "0.50". 
For ".60" substitute "$2.00". 
For "$50.40" substitute "$200.00". 
For "$126.00" substitute "$500.00". 
For "$35.28" substitute "$100.00". 
For "$75.60" substitute "$300.00". 
For "$3.20" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$1.60" substitute "$5.00". 
For "$10.08" substitute "$50.00". 
For "$0.08" substitute "$0.50". 
For "$0.12" substitute "$0.50". 
For "$5.04" substitute "$20.00". 
For "$15.12" substitute "$50.00". 
For "$0.60" substitute "$2.00". 
For "$0.24" substitute "$1.00". 
For "$0.08" substitute "$0.24". 

For "ninety-six dollars" substitute "one 
thousand dollars". 

For "one dollar and twenty cents" substitute 
"ten dollars". 

For "$1.00" and "$0.50" substitute respec. 
tively "$5.00" and "$3.00". 

531 



532 

LAw TO BE AMENDED 

Detention of Animals (Scale of Charges) 
Regulations-Oontd. 

Regulation 3 

Regulation 3 Provi8o 
Summary Offences Ordinance, 

Ch. 4. No.17 
Fees chargeable by Licensed Guides, 

R.G. 24.10.46 

Legitimation Ordinance, 
Ch.5.No.13 

Schedule 
Paragraph5 

Subsidiary Legi8lation Regulations 
(1950Ed. Vol. VIllp. 72) 

Regulation 6 

Absconding Debtors Ordinance, 
Ch.6.No.4 
Section3 

Section 4 

Section 13 

Bankruptcy Ordinance, 
Ch.6.No. 6 
Section 6(1)(a) 

Section 24(1)(c) 

Section 37(1)(b) 

Section 37(1)(c) 

Section 39(4) 

Section 45(2) 

Section 89(3) 

Section 114 

Notice 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For each of the figures in the first column 
below wherever it appears in this regulation, 
substitute the figure opposite to it in the 
second column 

$ c. $ c. 
I 00 6 00 

75 4 00 
50 3 00 
40 2 00 
25 I 00 
08 50 

For "$1.00" substitute "$5.00". 

For "50 cents" substitute "$5.00". 

For "two dollars and forty cents" substitute 
"four dollars". 

For "$1.20" substitute "$2.00"; for "$0.60" 
substitute "$1.00", and for "$2.40" sub. 
stitute "$4.00". 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "two 
hundred and fifty dollars". 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "two 
hundred and fifty dollars". 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "two 
hundred and fifty dollars". 

For "two hundred and forty dollars" substi. 
tute "five hundred dollars". 

For "twenty-four dollars" substitute "two 
hundred dollars". 

For "two hundred and forty dollars" substi-
tute "one thousand dollars". 

For "one hundred and twenty dollars" sub. 
stitute "five hundred dollars". 

For "two hundred and forty dollars" substi-
tute "one thousand dollars". 

For "ninety-six dollars" substitute "five 
hundred dollars". 

For "one hundred and twenty dollars" sub-
stitute "five hundred dollars". 

For "one thousand, four hundred and fort 
dollars" substitute "five thousand dollars". 



LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Bankruptcy Ordinance, 
Ch. 6. No. 6-0ontd. 
Section 140(l)(a) 

Section 141 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Bankruptcy Rules 

( 1950 Ed. Vol. VIII p. 96) 
Rule 55 

Section 81(2) 
Section 90 
Section 96(2) 
Section 275 
Section 280 
Section 281 

Section304 
APPENDIX 

Part2 
Fees Payable to Registrar 

1st Item 
2nd Item 
4th Item 
6th Item 
7th Item 
8th Item 
9th Item 

lOth Item 
11th Item 
12th Item 

Fees Payable to Receiver 
1st Item 
2nd Item 
3rd Item 
4th Item 
5th Item 
6th Item 
7th Item 

10th Item 
lith Item 
15th Item 

Deeds of Arrangement Ordinance, 
Ch. 6. No.7 
Section 5(5) 

Notice 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "one thousand two hundred dollars" and 
"four hundred and eighty dollars" substi-
tute "two thousand dollars" and "one 
thousand dollars", respectively. 

For "ninety-six dollars" substitute "one 
thousand dollars". 

For "$5.04" substitute"$40.00" and, 
For "16 cents per folio of ninety words" 

substitute "fifty cents per folio of seventy-
two words". 

For "$1,440" substitute "$5,000". 
For "8 cents" substitute "50 cents". 
For "$240.00" substitute "$1,000.00". 
For "$24" substitute "$200". 
For "6 cents" substitute "50 cents". 
For "6 cents" substitute "50 cents", and 
For "24 cents" substitute "50 cents". 
For "$1,440" substitute "$5,000". 

For "$1.20" substitute "$5.00". 
For "$1.20" substitute "$5.00". 
For "40 cents" substitute "$1.00". 
For "$7.20" substitute "$25.00". 
For "$1.20" substitute "$1.50". 
For "$0.48" substitute "$1.00". 
For "$14.40" substitute "$20.00". 
For "$1.20" substitute "$1.50". 
For "$4.80" substitute "$10.00''. 
For "$0.48" substitute "$1.00". 

For "$0.48 substitute "$1.00". 
For "$0.24" substitute "$0.50". 
For "$0.08" substitute "$0.50". 
For "$0.48" substitute "$4.00". 
For "$0.48" substitute "$2.50". 
For "$0.48" substitute "$1.00". 
For "$0.48" substitute "$1.00". 
For "$0.24" substitute "$1.00". 
For "$0.48" substitute "$1.00". 
For "$1.20" substitute "$1.50". 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "one 
hundred dollars". 

533 



534 -Notice 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Deeds of Arrangement Ordinance, 
Ch. 6. No. 7-0ontd. 

Section 7(2) 

Section 11 

Section 12(5) 

Schedule 
Item 1(i)(a) 

Item 1(i)(b) 

Item 1(ii) 

ltem2 

Item3 

Item4 

Item5 

Item6 

Item 7 

ItemS 

Solicitors Ordinance, 
Ch. 7.No.4 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Solicitors (Professional Charges) Order, 

1950 
Clause 2(b) 
Clause 3(1) 

Clause 3(3) 

Clause 3(4) 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "twenty.four cents" substitute "twenty-
five cents" and for "four hundred and 
eighty dollars" substitute "five hundred 
dollars". 

For "twenty-four cents" substitute "one 
dollar". 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "one 
hundred dollars". 

For "$4,800" substitute "$10,000" and for 
"$4.80" substitute "$10.00". 

For "$4,800" substitute "$10,000" and for 
"$9.60" substitute "$20.00". 

For "$9.60" substitute "$20.00". 

For "$1.20" substitute "$2.00". 

For "$0.60" substitute "$2.00". 

For "$0.24" substitute "$1.00". 

For "$480" substitute "$1,000", for "$2,400" 
substitute "$5,000", for "$1.80" substitute 
"$5.00", and for "$0.90" substitute 
"$2.00". 

For "$0.36" substitute "$1.00". 

For "$7.20" substitute "$15.00". 

For "$36" substitute "$50", for "$480" 
substitute "$500", for "$24,000" substitute 
"$25,000", for "$7.20" substitute "$10.00", 
and for "$3.60" substitute "$5.00". 

For the words: "On every $480 or fraction of 
$480 beyond $24,000" substitute "On every 
$1,000 or fraction of $1,000 beyond 
$25,000". 

For "$15.12" substitute "$20.00". 
For "$48.00" substitute "$70.00". 
For "$2,400" substitute "$3,500". 
For "$20.00" substitute "$30.00". 
For "$25.00" substitute "$35.00". 
For "$35.00" substitute "$50.00". 
For "$50.00" substitute "$75.00". 
For "$75.00" substitute "$100.00". 
For "$10.00" substitute "$15.00". 
For "$15.12" substitute "$20.00". 

For "$15.00" substitute "$20.00", and for 
"$10.00" substitute "$15.00". 



Notice 535 

LAW TO BE AMENDED AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

Interpreters Ordinance, 
Ch. 7. No.8 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Interpreters Rules 

(1950 Ed. Vol. VIII p. 250) 
Rule 3 
RuleS 

Supplemental Police 
Ordinance, 

Ch. 11. No.2 
Section 26 

Medical Service Ordinance, 
Ch. 12. No.1 

SubBidiary LegiBlation 
Regulations for Medical Attendance on 
the Poor 
(1950 Ed. Vol. VIII p. 347) 

Regulation 3 
Form 8 

Quarantine Ordinance, 
Ch. 12. No. 15 

First Schedule 
Quarantine (Maritime) Regulations 
Regulation 39(2) 
Regulation 50(2) 

Second Schedule 
Quarantine (Air) Regulations 
Regulation 33(2) 

Burial Grounds Ordinance, 
Ch. 12. No. 18 

Subsisiary Legislation 
Public Burial Grounds 

Regulation 1953 (G.N. 190/1953) 
Regulation 15 

Pilotage Ordinance, 
Ch. 18. No.3 
Section 7(1)(i) 

Section 21 

Subsidiary LegiBlation 
Pilotage Bye·Laws (G.N. 113/1957) 
Bye-law 5(3) 

For "$10.08" substitute "$25.00". 
For "$5.04" substitute "$10.00". 

For "nine dollars and sixty cents" substitute 
"one hundred dollars". 

For "12 cents" substitute "one dollar". 
For "12 cents" substitute "one dollar" 

wherever it appears. 

For "ten dollars" substitute "sixty dollars". 
For "one hundred dollars" substitute "six 

hundred dollars". 

For "one hundred dollars" substitute "six 
hundred dollars". 

For "$1.20" substitute "$5.00". 
For "72 cents" substitute "$2.00". 
For "$9.60" substitute "$10.00". 

For "five hundred dollars" substitute "four 
thousand dollars". 

For "one dollar" substitute "ten dollars". 

For "fifteen dollars" substitute "thirty 
dollars". 

For "five dollars" substitute "ten dollars". 

-.... 

i 

'J 



r 
536 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Pilotage Bye-Laws-Oontd. 

Bye-law 15(1) 
Bye-law 15(2) 

Bye-Law 16A 
Schedule I 

Schedule II 

Notice 

AlliENDMENTSTOBEMADE 

For "$15.00" substitute "$30.00". 
For each sum in the first column below 

substitute the sum opposite to it in the 
second column: 

$ c. 
02 

40 00 
01 

20 00 
01 

20 00 
01 

15 00 
01 

15 00 

$ c. 
05 

100 00 
05 

40 00 
05 

40 00 
05 

30 00 
05 

30 00 

For "15 cents" substitute "thirty cents". 
For each sum in the first column below 

substitute the sum opposite to it in the 
second column: 

$ c. 
22 00 
24 00 
26 00 
28 00 
30 00 
40 00 
45 00 
50 00 
55 00 
60 00 
65 00 
70 00 
75 00 
80 00 
90 00 

100 00 
uo 00 
120 00 
130 00 
140 00 
145 00 
150 00 

5 00 

$ c. 
50 00 
50 00 
75 00 
75 00 
75 00 

100 00 
100 00 
100 00 
150 00 
150 00 
150 00 
150 00 
150 00 
200 00 
200 00 
200 00 
250 00 
250 00 
300 00 
300 00 
300 00 
300 00 

10 00 

For each sum in the first column below 
substitute the sum opposite to it in the 
second column: 

$ c. 
15 00 

5 00 
2 50 

25 00 
10 00 

5 00 
2 50 

$ c. 
30 00 
10 00 
5 00 

50 00 
20 00 
10 00 
5 00 



LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Recruiting of Workers 
Ordinance, 
Ch. 22.No. 7 

Schedule 

Trade Unions Ordinance, 
Ch. 22. No.9 
Section 19(b) 

Section 23 

Subsidiary LegiBlation 
Trade Unions Regulations 

(1950 Ed. Vol. IX p. 32 N.) 
Regulation 23 

Regulation 24 

Regulation 25(1)(a) 
Regulation 25(1)(b) 

Regulation 25 (1)(c) 

Regulation 25(1)(d) 

Agricultural Contracts Ordinance, 
Ch. 23. No.6 
Section 21 

Section 37 
Section 53 

Second Schedule 
First Item 

Second Item 
Other Fees 

Item 1 
Item 2 
Item 3 

Third Schedule 
First Item (a) 
First Item (b) 
Second Item 
Third Item 
Fourth Item 

Fifth Item 
Sixth Item 

Notice 

.AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

In Regulation 16, 
For "$50" substitute "$400". 
For "$25" substitute "$200". 
For "$100" substitute "$1,000" 
For "$200" substitute "$2,000". 

For "twenty-four cents" substitute "fifty 
cents". 

For "two hundred and forty dollars" sub-
stitute "five hundred dollars". 

For "six cents" substitute "twenty-five 
cents". 

In the seventh item, for "$0.08" substitute 
"$0.10". 

For "$6.00" substitute "$50.00". 
For "$6.00" substitute "$50.00 and for 

"$4.00" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$24.00" substitute "$100.00" and for 

"$4.00" substitute "$10.00" 
For "$72.00" substitute "$200.00" and for 

"$4.00" substitute "$10.00". 

For "twenty-four cents" substitute "two 
dollars". 

For $4.80" substitute "forty dollars". 
For "one-hundred and ninety-two dollars" 

substitute "two thousand dollars". 

For "96" substitute "$500" 
For $1.92" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$0.96" substitute "$5.00". 

For "0.24" substitute "$1.00". 
For "0.24" substitute "$1.00". 
For "0.24" substitute "$2.00" 

For "5.04" substitute "$7.50". 
For "$15.12" substitute "$20.00". 
For $25.20" substitute "$40.00". 
For $15.12" substitute "$20.00". 
For "$15.12" substitute "$20.00". 
For "$50.40"' substitute "$75.00". 
For "$5.04" substitute "$7.50". 
For "$25.20" substitute "$40.00" 

537 



538 Notice 

LA.w TO BE AMENDED 

Farmers Advances Ordinance, 
Ch. 23. No. 10 
Section 8 

Production of Cane Ordinance, Ch. 23. 
No. 12. 
Section 13(1) 

Sale of Produce Ordinance, Ch. 23. No. 18. 
Section 7 
Section 8(1){a) 
Section 10(2) 
Section 32(a) 
Section 33(a) 

Schedule 

Forests Ordinance, Ch. 24. No. 1 
Section 14(1) 
Section 21(a) 

Veterinary Surgeons Ordinance, 
Ch. 25. No.1 
Section 6 

Dogs Ordinance, Ch. 25. No. 4 

Section 6(12)(c) 
Schedule 

Mongoose Ordinance, Ch. 25. No. 6 
Section 6(2) 

Pounds Ordinance, Ch. 25. No. 8 
Section 9(3) 

Mines, Borings and Quarries Ordinance, 
Ch. 26. No. 4. 
Section 11 
Section 13(2) 

Pipelines Ordinance, Ch. 26. No. 9. 

Subsidiary Legislation 
The Pipe-lines (Specification of Fees) Order, 

1957 (G.N. No. 63/1957) 
Clause 2(a) 
Clause 2(b) 
Clause 2(c) 
Clause 2(d) 
Clause 2(e) 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "twelve cents" substitute "one dollar" 
wherever it occurs. 

For "twenty-five cents" subsitute "one dollar" 

For "$4.80" substitute "fifteen dollars". 
For "$24" substitute "one hundred dollars". 
For "$14.40" substitute "fifty dollars". 
For "$4.80" substitute "forty dollars". 
For "$24" substitute "one hundred and fifty 

dollars". 
LTJ.FormB, 

For "$24" substitute "$150.00". 
In Form G, 

For "$4.80" substitute $40.00". 

For "$4.80" substitute "forty dollars". 
For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "four 

hundred dollars". 

For "824" substitute "fifty dollars". 

For "ten dollars" substitute "twenty dollars". 
For each of the sums, "$1.50", "$1.00" and 

"$0.50", substitute "$5.00". 

For "twenty-four cents" substitute "two 
dol ars". 

For "sixty cents" substitute "five rlollars"· 

For "$1.20" substitute "five dollars". 
For "$4.80" substitute "twenty-five dollars". 

For "2 cents" substitute "four cents". 
For "$4.80" substitute "ten dollars". 
For "$4.80" substitute "ten dollars". 
For "2 cents" substitute "four cents" 
For "$4.80" substitute "ten dollars". 



Notice 

LAW TO BE AMENDED AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 
The Pipe-lines (Specification of Fees) Order, 

1957-0ontd. 
Clause 2{f) For "2 cents" substitute "four cents". 
Clause 2(g) For "$4.80" substitute "ten dollars". 

Asphalt Industry Regulation, Ch. 26. No. 10 

Section 9(2) 

Section 12 

Section 15 

Land Acquisition Ordinance, Ch. 27. No. 10 

For "$1.20" substitute "ten dollars". 

For "twenty-four dollars" substitute "one 
hundred dollars". 

For "twenty-four dollars" wherever it appears 
in the section substitute "one hundred 
dollars". 

Section 18(8) For "one hundred and twenty dollars" 

Rent Restriction Ordinance, Ch. 27. No. 18 

Suhsidiary Legislation 
Rent Restriction Rules (1950 Ed. Vol. IX 

p. 241) 
Rule: 12 

substitute "one thousand dollars". 

First Item For "72 cents" substitute "two dollars". 
Second Item For "12 cents" substitute "fifty cents". 
Third Item For "24 cents" substitute "one dollar". 
Fourth Item For "72 cents" substitute "two dollars". 
Fifth Item For "24 cents" substitute "one dollar". 
Sixth Item For "24 cents" substitute "one dollar". 

Rule 13 For "$24" substitute $200" and for "$35.28" 

Registrar General Ordinance, Ch. 28. No. 1 
Schedule of Fees 22nd Item 

substitute "$300". 

(For search of a single index) For "0.12" substitute "0.50". 

Births and Deaths Registration Ordinance, 
Ch. 29. No. 1 
Section 21(3) 
Section44 

Third Schedule 
Item 1 
Item 2 
Item 3 
Item 4 
Item 5 

Marriage Ordinance, Ch. 29. No. 2 
Section 12(3) 
Section 14 
Section 17 
Section 18 

For "24 cents" substitute "one dollar". 
For "24 cents" substitute "seventy-five cents" 
For "12 cents" substitute "50 cents" and for 

"60 cents" substitute "one dollar". 

For "$2.00" substitute "$10.00" 
For "$1.00" substitute $2.00". 
Delete 
Delete 
For "$1.00" substitute "$2.00". 

For "24 cents" substitute "50 cents" 
For "24 cents" substitute "50 cents". 
For "24 cents" substitute "50 cents". 
For "$25.00" substitute "$30.00". 

539 



540 Notice 

LAw TO BE AMENDED AMENDMENTS To BE MADE 
Marriage Ordinance, Ch. 29. No. 2-0ontd. 

Section 20(l)(d) For "$25.00" substitute "$30.00". 
Section 24 For "$2.50" substitute "$3.00". 
Section 28 For "$5.00" substitute "$10.00". 

Hindu Marriage Ordinance, Ch. 29. No. 5 
Schedule Part II 
Fourth Item 

Explosives Ordinance, Ch. 30. No.4 
Section 6(2) 

Section 11(5) 
Section 12(6) 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Importation, Storage, etc., of Dynamite 

Regulations 

For "0.50" substitute "$1.00". 

For "four cents" substitute "twenty-five 
cents". 

For "$9.60" substitute "$25.00" 
For "$4.80" substitute "$15.00". 

(1950 Ed. Vol. IX p. 326) Regulation 28 For "$10.08" substitute "$20.00". 

Storage of Dynamite Regulations 
Regulation 2 For "6 cents" substitute "25 cents". 

Old Metal and Marine Stores Ordinance, 
Ch. 30.No. 7 
Section 4(3) 

Newspapers Ordinance, Ch. 30. No.8 
1st Item 
2nd Item 
3rd Item 
4th Item 
5th Item 

Cinematograph Ordinance, Ch. 30. No. 10 
Schedule 

Boxing Control Ordinance, Ch. 30. No. 12 
Schedule Part I 
Paragraph 3(3) 

Paragraph 9(a) 
,Paragraph 9(b) 

Licensing of Dealers (Precious Metals 
and Stones) Ordinance, Ch. 30. No. 14 
Section 4(3) 

For "$2.40" substitute "twenty dollars". 

For "$2.50" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$10.00" substitute "$30.00". 
For "$1.25" substitute "$2.00". 
For "$1.25" substitute "$2.00". 
For "$1.25" substitute "$5.00". 

In paragraph 29-
For "$1.50" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$0.15" substitute "$1.00". 
For "$0.65" substitute "$5.00". 
For "$0.08" substitute "$1.00". 
In paragraph 31-
For "fifty cents" substitute "four dollars". 

For "$2.40" and "$1.20" substitute "$15.00" 
and "$10.00" respectively. 

For "$50.00" substitute "$100.00". 
For "$25.00" substitute "$50.00". 

For "$2.40" substitute "$20.00". 



Notice 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Electrical Installations (Buildings) 
Ordinance, Ch. 30. No. 15 
Schedule B 
Item 1 
Item 2 
Item 3 
Item 4 

Electricity (Inspection) Ordinance, Ch. 30. 
No. 16 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Electricity Inspection Rules 

(1950Ed. Vol. IXp. 337) 
Schedule B 
Item (a) 

Item (b) 

Item (c) 

Registration of Business Names Ordinance, 
Ch. 31. No. 3 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Business Names Rules (1950 Ed. Vol. IX 

p. 348) 
Rule 10(a) 
Rule 10(c) 

Rule 10(d) 

Rule 10(e) 

Rule 10{!) 

Bills of Sale Ordinance, 
Ch. 31.No. 8 
Section 13 

Sale of Goods Ordinance, 
Ch. 31. No.9 
Section 6(1) 

Auctioneers Ordinance, 
Ch. 31. No. 10 
Section 5(1) 

Section 14(1)(c) 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "$1.20" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$0.60" substitute "$5.00". 
For "$1.20" substitute "$10.00. 
For "$2.40" substitute "$15.00". 

For "$1.00-plus 10 cents" substitute "$2.00 
-plus 20 cents." 

For "$1.00-plus 10 cents" substitute "$2.00 
-plus 20 cents." 

For "$2.00-plus 10 cents" substitute "$4.00 
-plus 20 cents." 

For "ten dollars" substitute "fifteen dollars". 
For "two dollars and fifty cents" substitute 

"five dollars". 
For "fifty cents" substitute "one dollar". 

For "one dollar and fifty cents" substitute 
"three dollars", and for "25 cents" substi-
tute "one dollar". 

For "ten dollars" substitute "fifteen dollars." 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "one 
hundred dollars". 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "one 
hundred dollars". 

For "$24" subctitute "$200.00". 
For "$2.40" susbstitute "$20.00". 
For "ninety-six dollars" substitute "eight 

hundred dollars''. 

541 



542 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 
Auctioneers Ordinance, 

Ch. 31. No. 10-Contd. 
Third Schedule 

Part! 

Part II 

Moneylenders Ordinance, 
Ch. 31. No. 11 
Section 3(1) 
Section 19(1) 

Section 25(1) 

Section 25(2) 

Rural Ped'ars Ordinance, 
Ch. 31. No.13 

Schedule 
Second Part 

Shop (Hours of Opening and Employ-
ment) Ordinance, 
Ch. 31. No. 14 
Section ll(e) 

Copyright 0. dinance, 
Ch. 31. No. 16 
Section 8(3) 

Patents and Designs Ordinance, 
Ch. 31. No. 18 
Section 4(3) 
Schedule II 

Notice 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "$50.40" substitute "$75.00". 
For "$182.40" substitute "$200.00". 
For "$5.04" substitute "$7.50". 
For "$10.08" substitute "$15.00". 
For "$15.12" substitute "$20.00". 
For "$25.20" subst.tute "$30.00". 
For "$35.28" substitute "$40.00". 

For "$4.80" substitute "$25.00". 
For "twenty-four cents" substitute "two 

dollars". 
For "twenty-four dollars" substitute "two 

hundred dollars". 
For "twenty-four dollars" substitute "two 

hundred dollars". 

For each sum in the first column below substi-
tute the sum opposite to it in the second 
coumn: 

$ c. 
480 
2 40 
7 20 

19 20 

$ c. 
40 00 
15 00 
75 00 

200 00 

For "five dollars" substitute "twenty-five 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "four 
hundred dollars". 

For "$4.80" substitute "$15.00". 
For each figure under column "A" substitute 

the figure opposite to it under column "B": 
"A" "B" 

s c. $ c. 
75 00 200 00 
10 00 30 00 
15 00 50 00 
10 00 30 00 
10 00 30 00 

2 00 5 Otl 
3 00 10 00 
3 00 10 00 
3 00 5 00 
3 00 5 00 
1 00 2 00 

lO 00 15 00 
10 00 15 00 



Notice 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Excise (General Provisions) Ordinance, 
Ch. 32.No. 8 

Subsidiary Legislat ·on 
The Excise (Fees) Regulations, 1957 

(G.N. 43/1957) 
Regulation 4(2) 

Regulation 4A (a)(i) 
Regulation 4A (a)(ii) 
Regulation 4A (b)(i) 
Regulation 4A (b)(ii) 

Spirits and Spirit Compounds Ordinance, 
Ch. 32.No. 9 
Section 7(1) 

Section 39(1) 
Section 66(1) 
Section 67(3) 
Section 72 
Section 74 
Section 75 
Section 81(1) 

Section 83 

Section 98 
Section 100 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Warehousing of Spirits Regulations 

(1950 Ed. Vol. IX p. 524) 
Regulation 7 

Brewery Ordinance, Ch. 32. No. 10 
Section 3(1) 

Copo·a Products Control Ordinance, Ch. 32. 
No.13 
Section 4(3) 

Cinematograph Entertainment Tax Ordi-
nance, Ch. 33. No. 10 
Section 10 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MAnE 

For each figure under Column "A" substitute 
the figure opposite to it under Column "B" 

"A" "B" 
$ c. $ c. 

36 00 50 00 
28 00 40 00 
36 00 50 00 
44 00 75 00 
67 00 120 00 
67 00 120 00 

For "27 cents" substitute "30 cents". 
For "8 cents" substitute "10 cents". 
For "41 cents" substitute "45 cents". 
For "12 cents" substitute "15 cents". 

For "forty-eight dollars" substitute "two 
hundred and fifty dollars". 

For "$4.80" substitute "$25.00". 
For "$48" substitute "$250". 
For "$2.40" substitute "$15.00". 
For "two cents'" substitute "ten cents". 
For "$48" substitute "$250". 
For "$1.80" substitute "$2". 
For "five dollars" substitute "twenty-five 

dollars". 
For "one dollar and twenty cents" substitute 

"one dollar and fifty cents". 
For "$48" substitute "$250". 
For "$9.60" substitute "$50.00". 

For "twenty-four cents", "forty-eight cents" 
and "four cents" substi. ute "fifty cents", 
"one dollar" and "ten cents", respectively. 

For "$4.80" substitute "$25.00". 

For "$4.80" substitute "$25.00". 

For "five dollars" substitute "twenty-five 
dollars". 

543 



544 Notice 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Local Savings Banks Ordinance, Ch. 35. 
No.4 
Section 6(1) 
Section 6(2) 
Section 33(2) 
Schedule-Fees 
Item I 
Items 3, 4, 5 and 7 

Item II 

Post Office Savings Bank Ordinance, 
Ch. 35. No. 5 
Schedule 

Post Office Savings Bank Regulations 
Regulation 4 

Regulation 6(2) 

Regulations 14A(a) and (b) 

Regulation 17 

Regulation 29(1) 

Regulation 31 

Post Office Ordinonce, Ch. 36. No. 1 
Subsidiary Legislation 
Post Office Regulations (150 Ed. Vol. IX, 

P. 589) 

Regulation 

Eegulation 4(f) 
Regulation 11A 
Regulation 13 
Regulation 34(2) 
Regulation 34( 4) 

Regulation 35 
Regulation 36 

Regulation 46A(1) 
Regulation 46A(2) 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "$4.80" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$4.80" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$24.00" substitute "$75.00". 

For "$2.40" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$1.20" substitute "$3.00" wherever it 

occurs. 
For "$0.60" substitute "$1.00". 

For "twenty-five cents" substitute "one 
dollar". 

For "twe:ve cents" substitute "one dollar". 

For "twenty-five thousand dollars" and "five 
thousand dollars" substitute "one hundred 
and twenty thousand dollars" and "twenty 
thousand dollars" respectively. 

For "twenty-five cents" substitute "one 
dollar". 

For "four hundred and eighty dollars" substi-
tute "one thousand dollars". 

For "four hundred and eighty dollars" 
substitute "one thousand dollars". 

For each figure under Column "A" substitute 
the figure opposite to it under Column "'B". 

Column "A" Column "B" 
s c. $ c. 

01 10 
01 05 
06 20 
01 10 
08 30 
12 40 
45 80 
20 80 
20 80 
05 10 
15 30 
15 30 



Notice 

LAWS TO BE AMENDED 

Post Office Regulations-Contd. 
Regulation 49(a) 

Regulation 54A(1) 
Regulation 54A(2) 

Regulation 77 
Regulation 80 
Regulation 81(2)(a) 

Regulation 81(2)(b) 

Regulation 90(2)(i)(b) 
Regulation 1ll(b) 

Regulation 122 

Regulation 152 
Regulation 156 

Regulation 157 
Regulation 177 

Trinidad and Tobago Electricity Commis-
sion Ordinance, Ch. 37. No. 5 
Section 74 

Building Societies Ordinance, 1 
Section 23 

Section 45(1)(a) 

Section 50 

Fr:endly Societies Housing Corporation 
Ordinance, Ch. 38. No. 3 
Section 23(2) 

San Fernando and Arima Hucksters, 
Pedlars and Porters Ordinance, 
Ch. 39. No. 10 

Second Schedule 
Fees payable:for Licences 

In the Borough of San Fernando 

In the Borough of Arima 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

$ c. $ c. 
24 00 25 00 
96 00 100 00 

15 
15 

40 
40 

For each figure under Column "A" substitute 
the figure opposite it to under Column "B" 

Column "A" Column "B" 
$ c. $ c. 

25 40 
40 70 
15 30 
20 40 
20 40 
25 50 
12 80 

30 00 50 00 
25 00 40 00 
15 00 25 00 
30 00 50 00 

3 00 5 00 
06 30 

24 00 25 00 
12 25 
06 20 
10 25 

For "twenty-four cents" substitute "two 
dollars". 

For "seven hundred and twenty" substitute 
"five thousand" wherever it appears. 

For "$24,000" substitute "$100,000". 
For "$2,400" substitute "$10,000". 
For "$4,800" substitute "$25,000". 
For "$14,400" substitute "$50,000". 
For "$24,000" substitute "$100,000". 
For "sixty-cents" substitute "one dollar". 

For "one dollar" substitute "two dollars". 

For "$1.20" substitute "$10.00" and for "$.30" 
substitute "$1.20". 

For "$1.20" substitute "$4.80" and for "$.36" 
substitute "$1.20". 

545 



546 Notice 

LAw TO BE AliiENDED 
Public Library Ordinance, 

Ch.42.No.2 
Subsidiary Legislation 
Library Regulations 

(1950 Ed. Vol. IX, p. 732) 
Regulation 15 

Central Library of Trinidad and Tobago 
Ordinance, Ch. 42. No. 4 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Central Library of Trinidad and Tobago 

Regulations 
(1950 Ed. Vol. IX, p. 738) 
Regulation 8 

Patents, Designs, Copyright and Trade-
marks (Emergency) Ordinance, 
Ch.42.No. 8 

Appendix A (List offees) 
Items 1 to5 

Animals (Diseases and Importation) Ordi-
nance, 
No.l9/1954 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Animals Importation Control Regulations 

(G.N. 27/1955) 
Ninth Schedule 

Trade Marks Ordinance, 
No.ll/1955 

Subsidiary Legislation 
G.N. 91/1956 

Trade Marks Rules Schedule 1 

Fees 

AliiENDliiENTS TO BE MADE 

For the words: "For each book-one cent per 
day for the first week. Two cents per day 
after the first week. For each magazine--<>ne 
cent per day. For each newspaper-one 
cent per day". 

substitute the words-
"For each book or publication-fifteen 

cents per week, or part thereof". 

For "two cents" substitute "fifteen cents". 

For "$9.60" substitute "$20.00". 

For the column of figures under the caption-
" I. Inspection Fees" substitute the 

following: 
"$ c. 
5 00 
4 00 
1 00" 

For the column of figures under the caption-
"2. Overtime Fees" substitute the fol-

lowing: 
"$ c. 
15 00 
15 00 
25 00 
15 00 
15 00 
25 00" 

For each sum in Column "A" below substitute 
the sum opposite to it in Column "B". 
Matter or 

Proceeding 
Item 

1 
1A 
1B 

Oolumn "A" 
$ c. 
30 00 
30 00 
30 00 

Oolumn "B" 
$ c. 

75 00 
75 00 
75 00 



Notice 547 

LAW TO BE AMENDED AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

Trade Marks Ordinance 
(No.ll/1955) 

Trade Marks Rules, Schedule 1 
Fees-Contd. Matter or 

Proceeding Column "A" Column "B" 
Item $ c. $ c. 
lo 30 00 75 00 
lD 30 00 75 00 
lD 150 00 300 00 
2 10 00 15 00 
3 15 00 20 00 
3A 10 00 20 00 
3B 15 00 50 00 
4 2 00 5 00 
4A 15 00 30 00 
5 15 00 50 00 
5A 15 00 50 00 
5A 2 00 5 00 
5B 15 00 50 00 
5o 15 00 50 00 
5o 2 00 5 00 
5D 15 00 30 00 
5E 15 00 30 00 
5E 2 00 5 00 
5F 15 00 30 00 
5G 15 00 30 00 
5G 2 00 5 00 
5H 5 00 15 00 
6 10 00 20 00 
6 2 00 5 00 
6A 10 00 30 00 

15 00 45 00 
20 00 60 00 

7 15 00 50 00 
2 00 5 00 

7A 15 00 30 00 
2 00 5 00 

7B 10 00 30 00 
2 00 5 00 

7o 10 00 30 00 
15 00 45 00 
20 00 60 00 

8 15 00 30 00 
20 00 40 00 
30 00 50 00 

SA 15 00 30 00 
2 00 5 00 

8B 20 00 40 00 
2 00 5 00 

30 00 40 00 
2 00 5 00 

9 5 00 15 00 
9A 5 00 15 00 

2 00 5 00 
10 30 00 60 00 
lOA 30 00 60 00 

2 00 5 00 
lOB 30 00 60 Oo 
lOo 15 00 50 Oo 
11 15 00 50 00 
llA 15 00 50 00 

10 00 30 00 
liB 15 00 30 00 
12 5 00 10 00 

2 00 5 00 



548 

LAW TO BE AlllE:tmED 

Trade Marks Ordinance, No. 11/1955 
Trade Marks Rules, 

Schedule 1 

Fees-Contd. 

Liquor Licences Ordinance, 
No. 27/1955 
Section 18 

Section 20(3) 

Second Schedule Duties 

Spirit Retailer: Licence 

Spirit Retailer Licence 

Wine Retailer Licence 

Hotel Spirit Licence 

Notice 

AME:tmlllENTS TO BE MADE 

Matter 
or Proceeding Column Column 

"A" "B" 
Item $ c. $ c. 

13 10 00 20 00 
14 5 00 15 00 

15 20 00 50 00 
15A 15 00 50 00 
16 5 00 10 00 
17 5 00 10 00 
18 20 00 50 00 
18A 10 00 30 00 

1 00 3 00 
19 10 00 20 00 
19A 10 00 20 00 
20 2 00 5 00 

1 00 3 00 
20A 2 00 5 00 

1 00 3 00 
21 1 00 2 00 
24 5 00 10 00 

For the words "twenty-four dollars" substi-
tute "one hundred dollars". 
For the words "five dollars" substitute the 
words "twenty dollars". 

For each sum in Column "A" below substitute 
the sum opposite to it in Colum "B": 

Column Colum 
"A" "B" 

$ c. $ c. 
For Port-of-Spain and 

and within half-a-mile 
thereof: per annum 1,200 00 2,500 00 
or if permitted under 
section 15: per quarter 330 00 700 00 
For San Fernando 
and within half-a-mile 
thereof: per annum 1,000 00 2,000 00 
or if permitted under 
under section 15: per 
quarter 275 00 550 00 
For any other town 
and within half-a-mile 
thereof: per annum 600 00 1,200 00 
or if permitted under 
section 15: per quarter 175 00 350 00 

Elsewhere: per annum 250 00 500 00 
or if permitted under 
section 15: per quarter 78 00 150 00 

For Port-of-Spain: per 
annum 100 00 250 00 

Elsewhere: per annum 75 00 150 00 

Hotels with up to 15 
300 00 600 00 rooms-per annum 



Notice 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 
Liquor Licences Ordinance-Contd. 

Hotel Spirit Licence-Contd. 

Special Hotel Licence 

Restaurant Licence 

Special Restaurant Licence 

Night Bar Licence 

Transfer fee under section 31 or section 32 
Occasional Licence under section 40 or 44 

Spirit Grocer Licence 

Spirit Dealer Licence 
Wine Merchant Licence 

Pharmacy Board Ordinance, 
No. 7/1960 
Section 31 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

Matter 
or Proceeding 

Item 
Hotels with 16 to 49 

rooms: per annum 
Hotels with 50 to 150 

Column 
"A" 
$ c. 

400 00 

Column 
"B" 
$ c. 

800 00 

rooms: per annum 500 00 1,000 00 

1,200 00 
Hotels with more than 

150rooms:perannum 600 00 
Hotels with up to 15 

rooms: per annum 1,000 00 2,000 00 
Hotels with 16 to 49 

rooms: per annum 1,250 00 2,500 00 
Hotels with 50 to 150 

rooms: per annum 1,500 00 3,000 00 
Hotels with over 150 

rooms: per annum 
For Port-of-Spain: per 

annum 
For San Fernando: per 

annum 
Elsewhere: per annum 
For Port-of-Spain and 

within half-a-mile 
thereof: per annum 

For San Fernando and 
within half-a-mile 
thereof: per annum 

Elsewhere: per annum 
For Port-of-Spain and 

within half-a-mile 
thereof: per annum 

For San Fernando and 
within half-a-mile 
thereof: per annum 

Elsewhere: per annum 

For Port-of-Spain: per 

2,000 00 

750 00 

600 00 
350 00 

1,400 00 

1,000 00 
600 00 

1,500 00 

1,200 00 
900 00 

6 00 
25 00 

4,000 00 

1,500 00 

1,200 00 
750 00 

2,000 00 

1,500 00 
1,000 00 

3,000 00 

2,500 00 
2,000 00 

15 00 
50 00 

annum 1,000 00 2,000 00 
or if permitted under 
section 15: per quar-
ter 

For San Fernando: per 
annum 
or if permitted under 
section 15: per quarter 

Elsewhere: per annum 
or if permitted under 
section 15: per quarter 
Per annum 
Per annum 

275 00 550 00 

800 00 1,600 00 

250 00 500 00 
400 00 1,000 00 

125 00 300 00 
400 00 1,000 00 
75 00 150 00 

For "five" substitute "fifteen" 

549 



550 Notice 

LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Pharmacy Board Ordinance-Oontd. 
No. 7{I960 
Section 39 

Workmen's Compensation Ordinance, 
No. 24{I960 

Section 2(I) para. (a) of proviso to defini-
tion of "workman" 
Section 5(I)(a)(iii) 

Section 9(6) 

Section 16(I) 

Section 43(2) 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Workmen's Compensation Regulations 

(I950 Ed. Vol. IX, p. 45) 
Fees 

Regulation 46 

Medical Referees Regulations 
(I950Ed. Vol. IX, p. 68) 
Regulation I2(I) 
Regulation I2(ii) 

Medical Board Ordinance, 
No. 35/I960 

Section 10(4) 
Section 38 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Medical Board Regulations 

Bye-law4 
Bye-law25 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "ten" substitute "twenty-five". 

For "two thousand eight hundred and eighty" 
substitute "five thousand". 

For "two hundred and fifty" substitute "five 
hundred". 

For "one hundred and fifty" substitute "two 
htmdred and fifty" 

For "two hundred and fifty" substitute "five 
hundred". 

For "two hundred and forty" substitute "five 
hundred". 

For each sum in Column "A" below substitute 
the sum opposite to it in Column "B": 

Item 

I( a) 
I( b) 

II(a) 
II(b) 

III( b) 
IV 
V(a) 
V(b) 
V(c:) 

VI( b) 
VII 

VIII 
IX 
X 

XI 
XII 

XIII 
XIV 

Oolumn "A" 
$ c. 

1 20 
I 20 

240 00 
1 20 
2 40 
1 20 
1 20 
I 20 
2 40 
1 20 
I 20 

24 
4 80 

48 
48 
12 
24 
48 
24 

Oolumn "B" 
$ c. 
2 00 
2 00 

500 00 
2 00 
5 00 
2 00 
2 00 
2 00 
5 00 
2 00 
2 00 

50 
IO 00 
I 00 
I 00 

I5 
50 

1 00 
50 

For "fifteen dollars" substitute "fifty dollars". 
For "twelve cents" substitute "thirty cents". 

For "fifty cents" substitute "one dollar". 
For "twenty-four" substitute "fifty". 

For "$2.40" substitute "$5.00". 
For "$144" substitute "$500". 



LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Muslim Marriage and Divorce Ordinance, 
No. 7/1961 

Schedule 
Part IT-Fees 

Schedule-Part IV 

Divorce Regulations 

Regulation 9 Item (a) 

Regulation 9 Item (b) 

Regulation 9 Item (c) 

Regulation 9 Item (d) 

Central Tenders Board Ordinance, 
No. 22/1961 
S3ction 28(1) 

Notice 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For each sum in column "A" below substitute 
the sum opposite to it in Column "B": 

Marriage registration 
fee (payable to Dis-
trict Registrar by 
Marriage Officers on 
transmitting certifi-
cate of marriage) 

On issue of certificate 
of registration of 
marriage 

Divorce registration 
fee (payable to Re-
gistrar General by 
the Secretary trans-
mitting certificate of 
divorce) 

For every search in any 
register book 

For every certified 
copy of any entry 

Payable to Registrar 
General 

On application for a 
dissolution or annu1-
ment of marriage 

On setting down 
hearing-
(i) an uncontested 

suit 
(ii) a contested suit 

On application for a 
decree absolute 

Column Column 
"A" "B" 
$ c. $ c. 

60 

60 

1 20 

24 

48 

25 00 

5 00 
15 00 

10 00 

1 50 

1 50 

3 60 

75 

1 50 

50 00 

10 00 
25 00 

20 00 

For the fees "$5.00" and "$2.00" substitute 
"$10.00" and "$5.00" respectively. 

For the fees "$5.00" and "$2.00" substitute 
"$10.00" and "$5.00" respectively. 

For the fees "$4.00", "$15.00" and "$25.00" 
substitute "$10.00", "$25.00" and "$40.00" 
respectively. 

For the fee "$2.00" substitute "$5.00". 

For "five hundred" substitute "one thou 
sand". 

551 



552 Notice 

LAw TO BE AMENDED 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Central Tenders Board Regulations 

(G.N. 137/1965) 
Regulation 11(3) 

Regulation 12(1) 

Regulation 12(2)(a) 

Regulation 12(2)(b) 

Regulation 12(3) 

Regulation 12(3)(a) 

Regulation 15 

Gambling and Betting Act (No. 22/1963) 
Section 19(2)(a)(ii) 
Section 20(2)(c) 

Section 20(2)(g) 
Section 32(1) 

First Schedule 
Paragraph 17(2)(a)(1) 
Paragraph 17(2)(b) 
Paragraph 17(2)(c) 

Subsidiray Legislation 
Gambling and Betting (Licences) Regula-

tions 1963 (G.N. 87/63) 
Regulation 7 

Central Bank Act (No. 23/1964) 
Section 17(2) 

Public Transport Service Act (No. 11/1965) 
Section 40(2) 
Section 40(3) 

Water and Sewerage Act (No. 16/1965) 
First Schedule 

Clause 4 

Clause 6 

Third Schedule 
Clause 23(2) 

Sugar Industry Control Board Act 
(No. 14/1966) 
Section 12(2) 
Section 12(3) 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "one hundred and fifty" substitute 
"five hundred". 

For "two thousand" substitute "five thou-
sand". 

For "two hundred and fifty" substitute 
"five hundred". 

For "two thousand" substitute "five 
thousand". 

For "two thousand" substitute "five 
thousand". 

For "two thousand" substitute "five 
thousand". 

For the words "one hundred dollars" 
wherever they occur, substitute "two 
hundred and fifty dollars", and for "five 
hundred dollars" substitute "one thousand 
dollars". 

For "$50.00" substitute "$150.00". 
For "$500" substitute "$1,500.00". 
For ".50c." substitute "$1.50". 
For "$5,000.00" substitute "$10,000.00". 
For "$50,000.00" substitute "$100,000.00". 

For "$12,500.00" substitute "$17,500.00". 
For "$250.00" substitute "$500.00". 
For "$250.00" substitute "$500.00". 

For ".25c." substitute ".75c.". 

For "twelve" substitute "twenty-four". 

For "forty-eight"substitute "one hundred". 
For "one hundred" substitute "two hundred 

and fifty". 

For "twenty-five cents" substitute "seventy-
five cents". 

For "twenty-five cents" substitute "seventy-
five cents". 

For "one dollar and fifty cents" substitute 
"five dollars". 

For "thirty-six" substitute "fifty". 
For "thirty-six" substitute "fifty". 



LAW TO BE AMENDED 

Representation of the People Act 
(No. 41/1967) 
Section 133(2)(a) 

Section 133(2)(b) 

Section 140(2) 

Third Schedule 
Election Rules 
Rule 9(2) 

Highways Act (No. 3/1970) 
Section 91(3) 

Firearms Act (No. 44/1970) 

Subsidiary Legislation 
Firearm Regulations (G.N. 13/1971) 

Schedule III 
Item 1 
Item 2 
Item 3 
Item4 
Item 5 
Item 7 
Item 8 
Item 12 
Item 14 

Notice 

AMENDMENTS TO BE MADE 

For "two thousand" substitute "four 
thousand". 

For "one thousand" substitute "two 
thousand". 

For "one thousand" substitute "two 
thousand". 

For "two hundred and fifty" and "one 
hundred" substitute "five hundred" and 
"two hundred", respectively. 

For "25c." substitute "50c.". 

For "$25.00" substitute "$40.00". 
For "$10.00" substitute "$15.00". 
For "$10.00" substitute "$15.00". 
For "$10.00" substitute "$15.00". 
For "$5.00" substitute "$10.00". 
For "$50.00" substitute "$100.00". 
For "$15.00" substitute "$25.00". 
For "$2.50" substitute "$5.00". 
For "$2.50" substitute "$5.00". 

Dated this 6th day of May, 1980. 

K. BOSWELL-INNISS 
Secretary to Cabinet 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Note is not part of the Notice, but is intended to explain its general purport) 

This instrument does not effect any immediate amendments to the laws. It merely 
signifies (in accordance with paragraph 4 of the Second Schedule to the Law Revision 
Act 1979) the President's approval to amendments the Law Revision Commission proposes 
to make in the Revised Edition. Any such amendments made will take effect on the coming 
into operation of the Revised Edition. 

553 


