
Legal Supplement Part B-Vol. 34, No. 107-12th JJ![ay, 1995 

LEGAL NOTICE No. 64 

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO 

THE SHIPPING ACT, 1987 

REGULATIONS 

MADE BY THE MINISTER OF WORKS AND TRANSPORT UNDER 
SECTION 225(1) OF THE SHIPPING AOT 

THE SHIPPING (NAVIGATIONAL AIDS DUES) (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS, 1995 

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Shipping (Navigational Aids Citation 
Dues) (Amendment) Regulations, 1995, 

363 

2, The Shipping (Navigational Aids 
are amended-

(a) in Part II ofthe Schedule-

Dues) (No.2) Regulations, 1989 Legal Notice 
No. 221 of 
1989 
amended 

(i) in item 1 by deleting the words "$0.03" and sub-
stituting the words" $0.05" ; 

(ii) in item 2 by deleting the words "$0.07" and sub-
stituting the words "$0.10"; 

(iii) in item 4(a) by deleting the words "thirty dollars" 
wherever they occur and substituting the words 
"fifty dollars"; 

(b) in Part III of the Schedule-
(i) in rule l(a) by deleting the word "fourteen" and 

substituting the word "twenty"; 
(ii) in rule 1 (b) by deleting the word "seven" and substituting 

tho word "ten", 

Made this 28th day of April, 1995. 

C. IMBERT 
Minister of Works and Transport 

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN 
REpUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGo-1995 


