
Legal Supplement Part A to the "Trinidad and Tobago Gazette", Vol. 21, 
No. 101, 15th April, 1982 

First Session Second Parliament Republic of Trinidad 
and Tobago 

HEPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO 

Act No.6 of 1982 

l L.S.] 

AN ACT to amend the Hire-Purchase Act, Chap. 82: 33 
[Assented to 8th April, 1982] 

ENACTED by the Parliament of Trinidad and Tobago as Enactment 

follows-
1. This Act may be cited as the Hire-Purchase Short title 

(Amendment) Act, 1982. 



18 

Section 3 of 
Chap. 82:33 
amended 

Section 14(12) of 
Chap. 82:33 
amended 

No.6 Hire-Purchase 1982 

2. Section 3 of the Hire-Purchase Act (hereinafter 
referred to as "the Act") is amended by substituting 
for the words "eight thousand" appearing in line four 
the words "fifteen thousand". 

3. Section 14(12) of the Act is amended by substi­
tuting for the words "two hundred and forty" occurring 
in line four the words "five thousand". 

Passed in the House of Representatives this 15th day 
of March, 1982. 

J. E. CARTER 
Clerk of the House 

Passed in the Senate this 30th day of March, 1982. 

R. GIUFFITH 
Clerk of the Senate 

GOVERNMENT PRINTERY, TRINIDAD, TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO-1982 


