
LEGAL NOTICE NO. 14

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO

THE CIVIL AVIATION ACT, 2001

REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE AUTHORITY WITH THE APPROVAL OF THE MINISTER

UNDER SECTION 33 OF THE CIVIL AVIATION ACT

THE  CIVIL  AVIATION  [(NO. 1)  GENERAL  APPLICATION  AND
PERSONNEL  LICENSING]  (AMENDMENT)  REGULATIONS,  2005

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Civil Aviation [(No. 1)
General Application and Personnel Licensing] (Amendment)
Regulations, 2005.

2. The Civil Aviation [(No. 1) General Application and Personnel
Licensing] Regulations, 2004 are amended—

(a) in regulation 190 by deleting the words “ten months” and
substituting the words “eighteen months”; and

(b) in regulation 193 by deleting the words “twelve months”
and substituting the words “eighteen months”.

Made by the Civil Aviation Authority this 20th day of January,
2005.

R.  LUTCHMEDIAL
Civil Aviation Authority

Approved by the Minister of Works and Transport this 20th day of
January, 2005.

F.  A.  KHAN
Minister of Works and Transport

Laid in the House of Representatives this        day of
,
2005.

J.  SAMPSON-JACENT
Clerk of the House

Laid in the Senate this        day of                    , 2005.

N.  JAGGASSAR
Clerk of the Senate

Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 44, No. 13—21st January, 2005 39

Citation

Legal Notice
No. 100 
of 2004
amended

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2005


