
AN ACT to amend the State Lands Act, Chap. 57:01 to
increase the penalties for digging or removing
materials on or from state lands without a licence

[Assented to 28th September, 2006]

Fourth  Session  Eighth  Parliament  Republic  of 
Trinidad and Tobago           

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO

Act No. 25 of 2006

[L.S.]

Legal Supplement Part A to the Trinidad and Tobago Gazette’’, Vol. 45,
No. 160, 2nd October, 2006

 



ENACTED by the Parliament of Trinidad and Tobago as
follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the State Lands
(Amendment) Act, 2006.

2. Section 6(6) of the Act is amended by deleting the
words “one thousand dollars” and substituting the
words “two thousand, five hundred dollars.”.

3. Section 25 of the Act is amended—
(a) in paragraph (a), by deleting—

(i) the words “four hundred dollars”
and substituting the words “one
hundred and twenty thousand
dollars and imprisonment for a
term of one year”; and

(ii) the words “two thousand dollars”
and substituting the words
“two hundred and fifty thousand
dollars and imprisonment for a
term of two years”; and

(b) in paragraph (b), by deleting—

(i) the words “two hundred dollars”
and substituting the words
“sixty thousand dollars and
imprisonment for a term of six
months”; and

(ii) the words “four hundred dollars”
and substituting the words
“one hundred and twenty
thousand dollars and imprison-
ment for one year”.

4. Section 29 of the Act is amended by deleting the
word “asphalt” wherever it occurs and substituting the
word “material”.

Enactment

Short title

Section 6 amended

Section 25
amended

Section 29 
amended

552 No. 25 State Lands (Amendment) 2006



5. Section 30 of the Act is amended by deleting the
words “two thousand dollars” and substituting the
words “two hundred and fifty thousand dollars and
imprisonment for a term of two years.”.

6. Section 31 of the Act is amended by—
(a) deleting the word “asphalt” wherever

it occurs and substituting the word
“material”;

(b) deleting the word “section” and
substituting the words “section 26”; and

(c) deleting the words “two thousand dollars”
and substituting the words “twenty
thousand dollars”.

Passed in the House of Representatives this 6th day
of September, 2006.

J. SAMPSON
Clerk of the House

Passed in the Senate this 20th day of September,
2006.

N. JAGGASSAR
Clerk of the Senate

Section 30
amended

Section 31
amended

No. 25 State Lands (Amendment) 2006 553

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2006


