Fifth Session Third Parliament Trinidad and Tobago
25 Elizabeth II

TRINIDAD anp TOBAGO

Act No. 36 of 1976

[L.S.]

AN Act to amend the Praedial Larceny Prevention
Act, 1963.

[Assented to 18th June, 1976]

BE 1T ENACTED by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, Enactment
by and with the advice and consent of the Senate and
House of Representatives of Trinidad and Tobago, and

by the authority of the same, as follows :—

1. This Act may be cited as the Praedial Larceny short title
Prevention (Amendment) Act, 1976.



342

No. 36 ‘Praedial Larceny Prevention 1976

Section 3 of
Act amended.
No. 12 of 1963

Section 4 of
Act amended

Section 7 of
Act amended

Section 9 of
Act amended

Section 12 of
Act amended

Section 13 of
Act amendegl

~ 2. Section 3 of the Praedial Larceny Prevention Act,
1963 (hereinafter referred to as “the Act”) is amended
by renumbering subsections (2) and (3) thereof as sub-
sections (4) and (5) and by inserting the following new
subsections therein:—

(43

(2) A person who in any place other than
a public market sells or otherwise disposes of
agricultural produce of the value of one
hundred dollars or more shall at the time of
delivery of the agricultural produce give a
signed memorandum of sale or delivery to
the purchaser or other person obtaining
possession or custody of the agricultural
produce setting out the particulars required
to be specified therein by subsection (1).

(3) A person who fails to comply with
the provisions of subsection (2) is guilty of an
offence and liable on summary conviction to a
fine of two thousand five hundred dollars.”.

3. Section 4(2) of the Act is amended by substituting
for the words “fifty dollars” at the end thereof, the words
“five hundred dollars”.

4. Section 7 of the Act is amended by renumbering
the section as section 7(1) and by adding the following
new subsection thereto:—

[13

(2) A person who on being required to
produce a memorandum of sale or delivery
under subsection (1) in respect of agricultural
produce of the value of one hundred dollars or
more fails to produce the memorandum of sale
or delivery is guilty of an offence and liable

- on summary conviction to a fine of two
thousand five hundred dollars.”.

5. Section 9(2) of the Act is amended by substituting
for the words “two hundred and fifty dollars” occurring
therein the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.

6. Section 12 of the Act is amended by substituting

~ for the words “two hundred and fifty dollars” occurring
therein the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.

7. Section 13(2) of the Act is amended by substituting

“for the words “two hundred and fifty dollars” occurring

therein the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.



No. 36 Praedial Larceny Prevention 1976

343

8. Section 26 of the Act is amended by substituting Section 26 of
for the words “two hundred and fifty dollars” occurring
therein the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.

9. Section 27 of the Act is amended by substituting Section 27 of
for the words “one hundred dollars” occurring therein °“ ™"
the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.

10. Section 28 of the Act is amended by substituting section 26 of
for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” occurrmg Act amended
therein the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.

11. Section 29 of the Act is amended by substituting jection 2 of
for the words “two hundred and fifty dollars” occurrmg
therein the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.

Passed in the House of Representatives this 11th day
of June, 1976.

J. E. CARTER
Clerk of the House

Passed in the Senate this 15th day of June, 1976.

R. L. GRIFFITH
Clerk of the Senate

GOVERNMENT PRINTERY, TRINIDAD, TRINIDAD AND ToBAGO—1976



. !
. . |
e . : |
. : . Y ‘M i
. | o R !
. . . y 5 N .




