Legal Supplement Part A to the “Trinidad and Tobago Gazette”, Vol. 39,
No. 8, 13th January, 2000

Fifth Session Fifth Parliament Republic of Trinidad
and Tobago

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO

Act No. 2 of 2000

[L.S.]

AN AcT to amend the Limitation of Certain Actions
Act, 1997

[Assented to 13th January, 2000]

EnacTED by the Parliament of Trinidad and Tobago as Enactment
follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the Limitation of Certain shorttitie
Actions (Amendment) Act, 2000.



6 No. 2 Limitation of Certain Actions (Amendment) 2000

Interpretation Act 2. In this Act, “the Act” means the Limitation of
No-300f1997 Certain Actions Act, 1997.

Section 204 3. The Act is amended by inserting after section 20
inserted the following section:
“Transitional ~ 20A. Section 4 of the Limitation of
tammensation Certain Actions (Amendment) Act, 1999
cases shall not apply to any action under section
4(3) and any claim under section 11(1) of
chap.88:05  the Workmen’s Compensation Act, brought
upon a right of action which accrued
before the commencement of the Act first
named in this section.”.

First Schedule 4. The First Schedule to the Act is amended by
amended inserting at the end thereof and under the respective
columns the following:

“Chap.88:05 fhe (i) in subsection (3) of section 4,
orkmen’s
Compensa: delete the words “one year”
10N AC -
and substitute the words “four

years”; and

(i1) in subsection (1) of section 11,
delete the words “six months”
and substitute the words “one

7 1N

year”.”.

Passed in the House of Representatives this 19th day
of November, 1999.

D. DOLLY
Acting Clerk of the House

Passed in the Senate this 15th day of December,
1999.

N. COX
Clerk of the Senate

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN
RepuBLIc oF TRINIDAD AND ToBAGO—2000



