Legal Supplement Part A to the “Trinidad and Tobago Gazette”, Vol. 25,
No. 16, 14th January, 1986

Fourth Session Second Parliament Republic of Trinidad
and Tobago

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO

Act No. 39 of 1985

[L.S.]

AN Act to amend the Jury Act, Chap. 6:53
[Assented to 31st December, 1985]

ENACTED by the Parliament of Trinidad and Tobago as enactment
follows : —

1. This Act may be cited as the Jury (Amendment) short title
Act, 1985.




3946 No. 39 Jury (Amendment) 1985

Chrerpretation 2. In this Act “the Act” means the Jury Act.

of the act ) 3. Section 4(1)(a) of the Act is amended by substitu-

amended ting for the words “sixty years” occurring in line two,
the words “sixty-five years”.

Section 6 of 4. Section 6 of the Act is amended by substituting

amended for the words “sixty years” wherever they occur the

words “sixty-five years”.
Passed in the Senate this S5th day of November, 1985.
R. L. GRIFFITH
Clerk of the Senate
Passed in the House of Representatives this 29th day
of November, 1985.

J. E. CARTER
Clerk of the House

GOVERNMENT PRINTERY, TRINIDAD, TRINTDAD AND TOBAGO-—1986



