
LEGAL NOTICE NO.  294

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO

THE HOUSING ACT,  CHAP.  33:01

REGULATIONS        

MADE BY THE AUTHORITY WITH THE APPROVAL OF THE MINISTER

UNDER SECTION 74(1)  OF THE HOUSING ACT

THE  HOUSING  (AMENDMENT)  REGULATIONS,  2000

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Housing (Amendment)
Regulations, 2000. 

2. In these Regulations “the Regulations” means the Housing
Regulations, 1986.

3. The Regulations are amended in section 6 by deleting the words
“two hundred and fifty thousand dollars” and substituting the words
“three hundred and fifty thousand dollars”.

4. The Regulations are amended in regulation 8(4) by deleting the
word “$300,000” and substituting the word “$350,000”.

5. This Order shall come into effect on 1st January, 2001.

Dated this 28th day of November, 2000.

J.  CLARKE
Acting Chairman

Ministry of Housing and Settlements

Approved by the Minister this 28th day of November, 2000.

J.  HUMPHREY
Minister of Housing and Settlements

Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 39, No. 241—1st December, 2000 883

Citation

Interpretation

No. 187 of 1986

Section 6
amended

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER,  PORT-OF-SPAIN

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2000

Commencement

Regulation 8
amended


