Legal Supplement Part A to the “Trinidad and Tobago Gazette”, Vol. 65,
No. 111, 29th June, 2026

Second Session Thirteenth Parliament Republic of
Trinidad and Tobago

- i
v —

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO

Act No. 16 of 2026

[L.S.]

AN AcT to make provisions of a financial nature and
other related matters

[Assented to 25th June, 2026]

ENACTED by the Parliament of Trinidad and Tobago as Enactment
follows:

1. This Act may be cited as the Finance Act, 2026. shot title

2. The Trustee Ordinance is amended— Cap. 4 of 1939
amended
(a) by inserting after section 2A, the following
section:
“Registrar 2B. Notwithstanding section

Goneesl mag 2A(1), the application for

registration  T€gistration of an express trust or



438

No. 16

Finance 2026

other form of legal arrangement
may be accepted after the
periods stipulated in section
2A(2) or section 2A(2A), subject
to the approval of the Registrar
General and upon submission of
the prescribed form and
payment of the prescribed fees,
together with a penalty of one
hundred dollars for every
month, or part thereof, that the
trustee of the express trust or
administrator of any other form
of legal arrangement fails to
comply with section 2A(2) or
section 2A(2A).”; and

(b) by inserting after section 13, the following

section:

“Filing form

14. (1) The Registrar General
shall determine whether any
document to be delivered to or
received by, filed with or
registered by the Registrar
General, is to be submitted in—

(a) a typed or printed
form; or

(b) an electronic form
via an electronic
system identified,
established or
maintained by the
Registrar General
for that purpose.

(2) Where a document is
submitted, delivered to or
received by, filed with or
registered by the Registrar
General via an electronic system
identified, established or
maintained by the Registrar
General for that purpose, that
document, endorsed as required,



No. 16

Finance 2026

439

with the word “Registered”, may
be provided in electronic form, to
the trustee of the express trust or
administrator of any other form of
legal arrangement.

(3) Any document to be
submitted or delivered to or
received by, filed with or
registered by the Registrar
General, shall be submitted in the
manner determined by the
Registrar General pursuant to
this section and must be
accompanied by valid
identification documents and any
other supporting documents, as
specified by the Registrar
General.”.

3. The Gambling and Betting Act is amended—

(a) in section 40(1), by deleting the words
“four thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “six thousand dollars”; and

(b) in section 40(2), by deleting the words “one
hundred and fifty dollars” and substitut-
ing the words “five hundred dollars”.

Chap. 11:19
amended

4. The Prison Service Act is amended in the Fifth chap. 13:02

Schedule—
(@)

in rule 4(1)—

(1)

(i1)

in paragraph (c), by deleting the word
“and”, in the second place where it
occurs;

in paragraph (d), by deleting the
word “.” and substituting the words
“; and”;

(iii) by inserting after paragraph (d), the

following paragraph:

amended



440 No. 16 Finance 2026

“(e) where an officer has acted in a
higher office for a continuous
period of not less than one
continuous year but less than
three continuous years
immediately prior to—

(1) the date of his
compulsory retirement;
or

(i1) the date on which he
proceeds on annual
leave immediately
preceding the date of his
compulsory retirement,

he shall be eligible to have his
pension, gratuity or other allowance
calculated as if he were substantively
appointed in that higher office
during the period of acting, and for
the purpose of calculating pensionable
emoluments, regulation 11(c) of the

cnap. 2352 Pensions Regulations, shall apply.”;
and

(b) in rule 4(1A), by deleting the words “rule
4(1)(d),” and substituting the words
“subrule (1)(d) and (e),”.

Chap. 15:01 5. The Police Service Regulations are amended in
amended regulation 183A—

(a) by inserting after subregulation (1), the
following subregulation:

“(1A) An officer in the First or Second
Division of the Police Service, who has
acted in a higher office for a continuous
period of not less than one continuous
year but less than three continuous
years immediately prior to—

(a) the date of his compulsory
retirement; or



No. 16 Finance 2026 441

(b) the date on which he
proceeds on annual leave
immediately preceding the
date of his compulsory
retirement,

shall be eligible to have his pension,
gratuity or other allowance
calculated as if he were substantively
appointed in that higher office during

the period of acting, and for the
purpose of calculating pensionable
emoluments, regulation 11(c) of the
Pensions Regulations, shall apply.”; chap. 2:52
and

(b) in subregulation (2), by deleting the
words “subregulation (1),” and substituting
the words “subregulations (1) and (1A),”.

6. The Registrar General Act is amended in section chap. 19:03
5B(1), by deleting the words “may determine” and * %
substituting the words “shall determine”.

7. The Registration of Clubs Act is amended— Chap. 21:01

amended

(a) in section 12(1), by deleting the words
“ten thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “fifteen thousand dollars”; and

(b) in section 12(2), by deleting the words
“five thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “seven thousand, five hundred
dollars”.

8. The Pharmacy Board Act is amended in section chap. 29:52
31(5), by deleting the words “five thousand dollars” and ™
substituting the words “seven thousand, five hundred
dollars”.

9. The Pesticides and Toxic Chemicals Act 1iS chap. 3003
amended in section 13(3)— amended

(a) in paragraph (a), by deleting the words
“two thousand dollars” and “four
thousand dollars” and substituting the
words “four thousand dollars” and “eight
thousand dollars”, respectively; and



442 No. 16 Finance 2026

(b) in paragraph (b), by deleting the words
“twenty thousand dollars” and substitut-
ing the words “thirty thousand dollars”.

Chap. 30:04 10. The Tobacco Control Act is amended by

amended repealing section 37 and substituting the following
section:

“Penalties 37. (1) Any person who

;f:;ﬂiiggg‘ contravenes sections 13 to 17A

commits an offence and is liable—

(a) on summary convic-
tion, to a fine of—

(1) one hundred
and fifty
thousand
dollars and
imprison-
ment for nine
months for
the first
offence;

@)t h r e e
hundred
thousand
dollars and
imprison-
ment for
eighteen
months for
the second
offence; and

i)t h r e e
hundred
thousand
dollars and
imprison-
ment for
twenty-seven
months for
the third
offence; or



No. 16 Finance 2026

443

(b) on conviction on
indictment, to a fine
of six  hundred
thousand dollars
and imprisonment
for three years.

(2) A person who contravenes
any provision of this Act for which
there is no penalty prescribed,
commits an offence and is liable—

(a) on summary convic-
tion, to a fine of three
hundred thousand
dollars and
imprisonment  for
eighteen months; or

(b) on conviction on
indictment, to a fine
of six  hundred
thousand dollars
and imprisonment
for three years.”.

11. The Fire Service Act is amended—
(a) in section 18, by—
(i) renumbering section 18 as section
18(1); and

(i1) inserting after subsection (1), the
following subsection:

“(2) The President may, by
Order, amend  the Fifth
Schedule.”; and

(b) in the Fifth Schedule, in clause 3(7A)—

(i) in paragraph (a), by deleting the
words “; and” and substituting the
word “;”;



444

No. 16 Finance 2026

Chap. 50:08
amended

Chap. 50:10
amended

(i1) by inserting after paragraph (a),
the following paragraph:

“(aa) has acted in a higher
office for a continuous
period of not less than one
continuous year but less
than three continuous
years immediately prior
to—

(i) the date of his
compulsory
retirement; or

(i1) the date on which
he proceeds on
annual leave
immediately
preceding the date
of his compulsory
retirement,

shall be eligible to have his
pension, gratuity or other
allowance calculated as if he were
substantively appointed in that
higher office during the period of
acting, and for the purpose of
calculating pensionable emoluments,
regulation 11(c) of the Pensions

Chap. 23:52 Regulations, shall apply; and”;
and

(iii) in paragraph (b), by
deleting the words
“paragraph (a)” and
substituting  the
words “paragraphs
(a) and (aa)”.
12. The Motor Launches Act is amended in
section 11, by deleting the words “two thousand dollars”

and substituting the words “seven thousand, five
hundred dollars”.

13. The Shipping Act is amended in section 244, by
deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and substituting
the words “one thousand dollars”.



No. 16

Finance 2026

445

14. The Petroleum Regulations are amended—

(@) in regulation 2, by inserting in the
appropriate alphabetical sequence, the
following definition:

marginal marine gas field” means an

offshore shallow water field with
recoverable gas 2C contingent
resources estimated at three
hundred billion cubic feet or less
and an internal rate of return of
less than fifteen per cent as a
standalone project, which comes
into production after 1st January,
2026, and is certified by the
Minister as a marginal marine gas
field;”; and

(b) in regulation 61—
(i) by inserting after subregulation

(1), the following subregulation:

“(1A) Notwithstanding sub-
regulation (1), every Exploration
and Production (Public
Petroleum Rights) Licensee or
contractor under a production
sharing contract shall pay a
royalty at the rate of eight per
cent on the net natural gas won
and saved from a marginal
marine gas field from the
licensed area or contract area.”;
and

(ii) by revoking subregulation (2) and

substituting the following
subregulation:

“2) The basis for determining
the value of petroleum for the
purposes of calculating royalty

Chap. 62:01
amended



446

No. 16

Finance 2026

Chap. 64:30
amended

Chap. 66:01
amended

payments in cash shall be
arrived at by agreement
between the Minister and the
licensee or contractor under a
production sharing contract on
terms specified in the licence or
production sharing contract by
adopting the criteria specified
in regulations 66 to 69
inclusive.”.

15. The Copra Products Control Act is amended—

(@)

(2]

(c)

in section 4, by deleting the words
“become a manufacturer of copra
products” and substituting the words
“manufacture copra products for sale”;

in section 13, by deleting the word
“manufacturer”, wherever it occurs, and
substituting the words “licensed
manufacturer”; and

in section 14—

(i) by inserting after the words “copra
products”, in the first place where
they occur, the words “, for sale”;
and

(i) by deleting the words “four
thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “eight thousand dollars”.

16. The Forests Act is amended—

(@)

(b)

in section 7A(5), by deleting the words
“one hundred thousand dollars” and
substituting the words “one hundred
and fifty thousand dollars”; and

by repealing section 7F(4) and substituting
the following subsection:

“(4) A person who contravenes
this section commits an offence
and 1is liable on summary
conviction to a fine of one
hundred and fifty thousand
dollars.”.



No. 16 Finance 2026 447

17. The Sawmills Act is amended— Chap. 66:02

(@) in section 4A(6), by deleting the words """
“three thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “ten thousand dollars”; and

(b) in section 5, by deleting the words “one
hundred thousand dollars” and “five
thousand dollars” and substituting the
words “one hundred and fifty thousand
dollars” and “seven thousand, five
hundred dollars”, respectively.

18. The Conservation of Wild Life Act is amended— chap. 67:01

amended

(a) in section 6(3), by deleting the words
“fifty thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “sixty thousand dollars”;

(b) in section 6(4), by deleting the words
“fifty thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “sixty thousand dollars”; and

(¢) in section 6(5), by deleting the words
“one hundred thousand dollars” and
substituting the words “one hundred
and fifty thousand dollars”.

19. The Animal (Diseases, Importation, Health and chap. 67:02
Welfare) Act is amended in section 15(3), by deleting the amended
words “fifty thousand dollars” and substituting the
words “sixty thousand dollars”.

20. The Exchequer and Audit Act is amended in chap. 69:01
section 43, by inserting the following subsections: amended

“2A) A Fund established in accordance
with this section may also include money
donated by any person.

(2B) Where money is received pursuant to
subsection (2A), a certificate in the form
approved by the Minister with responsibility for
finance shall be issued to verify the receipt of

the money.”.
21. The Income Tax Act is amended— Chap. 75:01
. . amended
(a) 1in section 8—

(i) in subsection (1), by inserting
after paragraph (¢), the following
paragraphs:



448 No. 16 Finance 2026

“(ta) with effect from

(tb)

January 1, 2026, the
income derived from an
approved deferred annu-
ity plan in accordance
with section 28—

(i) purchased by an
individual who is a

resident of
Trinidad and
Tobago; and

(i1) which matures

between the ages of
fifty and seventy
years of  the
individual,
with effect from
January 1, 2026, upon
maturity, the income
from an approved pension
fund plan in accordance
with section 28, to which
contributions have been
made by or on behalf of
an individual who is a
resident of Trinidad and
Tobago;”; and

(i) by inserting after subsection (1A),
the following subsection:

“(1B) The reference to an
approved pension fund plan or
approved deferred annuity plan
in subsection (1)(ta) and (¢b)
refers to a plan approved before,
on or after January 1, 2026.”;

(b) by inserting after section 18C, the
following section:

“Deduction
for
contributions

18D. (1) An individual

who, in any year of income,

to Funds makes a bona fide contribution
established — to a Fund, shall be entitled
Borte " to deduct the amount of such

Exchequer  contribution in ascertaining

and Audit Act

his chargeable income.



No. 16 Finance 2026

449

(2) A deduction
under this section shall not
exceed the lower of—

(a) twenty per
cent of the
total income
of the indi-
vidual  for
that year of
income; or

b)twenty
thousand
dollars.

(3) For the purposes
of this section—

“ “Fund” means a
Fund estab-
lished pursuant
to section 43 of
the Exchequer
and Audit Act;
and

“contribution”
means money
donated to a
Fund, as
verified by a
certificate
issued in
accordance
with  section
43(2B) of the
Exchequer and
Audit Act.”;

(c) in section 28, by repealing subsection (9)
and  substituting the following
subsection:

“(9) For the avoidance of doubt, any
sum received when an approved pension
fund plan or an approved deferred
annuity plan is surrendered before the
date of retirement or maturity shall be
subject to tax.”; and



450 No. 16 Finance 2026

(d) by inserting after section 48N, the
following section:

“Tax credit for
landlord’s
annual tax
liability

Chap. 77:01

480. A landlord who pays
the Landlord Business
Surcharge pursuant to
Part XVII of the
Miscellaneous Taxes Act
shall be entitled to a tax
credit against his annual
income for a year of income
of any payment made in
respect of his income tax
liability for that year of
income up to a maximum of
his annual income liability.”.

Chap. 75:02 22. The Corporation Tax Act is amended—

amended

(a) by inserting after section 10Z, the

following section:

“Deduction
for
contributions
to Funds
established
under
section 43
of the
Exchequer
and Audit
Act

10AA.(1) Notwithstanding
any other provision of this
Act, where in a year of
income commencing
1st January, 2026, a company
makes a bona fide contribution
to a Fund, that company
shall be entitled to deduct
the amount of such
contribution in ascertaining
its chargeable profits for
that year of income.

(2) A deduction

under this section shall not
exceed the lower of—

(a) fifteen per
cent of the
chargeable
profits of the
company for
that year of
income; or

(b) one hundred
thousand
dollars.



No. 16

Finance 2026

451

(3) For the purposes
of this section—
“Fund” means a
Fund estab-
lished pursuant

to section 43 of

the Exchequer
and Audit Act;
and

“contribution”
means money
donated to a
Fund, as
verified by a
certificate
issued in
accordance
with  section
43(2B) of the
Exchequer and
Audit  Act.”;
and

(b) by inserting after section 16L, the

following section:

“Tax credit 16M. A company which

for annual | pays the Landlord Business
ax 1apb1lr
wherea . Surcharge pursuant to

companyis  Part XVII of the

a

landlord .
Chap. 77:01 Miscellaneous Taxes Act

shall be entitled to a tax

credit against its annual
income for a year of income
of any payment made in
respect of its income tax

liability for that year of
income up to a maximum of

its annual income liability.”.

23. The Miscellaneous Taxes Act is amended—

(@)

(b)

in section 30(4), by deleting the words
“three thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “five thousand dollars”;

in section 75(3), by deleting the words
“gross assets”, wherever they occur, and

substituting the words “total assets”;

Chap. 77:01
amended



452 No. 16 Finance 2026

(¢) in section 75(4), by deleting the words
“gross assets” and substituting the
words “total assets”;

(d) 1in section 81—

(i) in subsection (1)(b), by inserting
after the word “dollars”, the words
“, irrespective of the number of
premises being let out by the
landlord”; and

(i1) by repealing subsections (4), (5)
and (6);

(e) 1in section 82—

(i) in subsection (1), by deleting the
words “a certificate to be known as
a certificate of registration”, and
substituting the words “a
certificate of registration and such
number of copies of the certificate
of registration, if any, as he

requires”; and
(i1) by repealing subsection (2);
(f) in section 83—
(i) by repealing subsection (1) and

substituting the following
subsection:

“(1) The landlord business
surcharge shall be payable by
a landlord in each quarter
ending on 31st March,
30th June, 30th September
and 31st December, in each
year of income.”;

(i1) by repealing subsections (2) and
(iii) by renumbering subsections (4),
(5), (6), (7) and (8) as subsections
(2), (3), (4), (5) and (6), respectively;

(g) in section 85—
(i) in subsection (1)(d), by deleting

the words “; and” and substituting
the word “.”;



No. 16 Finance 2026

453

(i1) by repealing subsection (1)(e); and

(iii) by inserting after subsection (1),
the following subsection:

“(1A) The Minister may, by
Order, amend the list of
persons or entities exempt
under this section.”; and

(h) 1in section 93(3)(d), by inserting after the
word “Minister”, the words “with
responsibility for finance”.

24. The Customs Act is amended in section 45(1)— chap. 78:01

(a) in paragraph (v), by deleting the word

.” and substituting the words “; and”;
(b) by inserting the following paragraph:

“(w) all goods produced from forced
labour as designated by the
Minister with responsibility
for trade;”.

25. The Companies Act is amended—
(a) in section 488—

(i) by repealing subsection (1) and
substituting the following subsec-
tion:

“(1) The Registrar shall
determine  whether any
document to be delivered to or
received by, filed with or
registered by the Registrar, is
to be submitted in—

(a) a typed or printed
form; or

(b) an electronic form via
an electronic system
identified, established
or maintained by the
Registrar for that
purpose.”;

(i1) by inserting after subsection (2),
the following subsection:



454 No. 16

Finance 2026

“(3) Any document to be
submitted or delivered to or
received by, filed with or
registered by the Registrar, shall
be submitted in the manner
determined by the Registrar
ursuant to this section and must
e accompanied by  valid
identification documents and any
other supporting documents, as
specified by the Registrar.”; and

(b) 1in section 489(1)—

(i) bgr deleting the full stop at the end
0 paragraph (g) and substituting
the words “; or”; and

(i1) bﬁr inserting after paragraph (g),
the following paragraph:

“(h) an application is made by
the company or other body
corporate, in the form
approved by the

Registrar.”.
Chap. 81:02 26. The Partnership Act is amended by inserting
amended after section 20 DA, the following section:

“Filing form

20DB. (1) The Registrar shall
determine whether any document to
be delivered to or received by, filed
with or registered by the Registrar, is
to be submitted in—

(a) a typed or printed
form; or

(b) an electronic form via
an electronic system
identified, established
or maintained by the
Registrar for that
purpose.

(2) Where a document is
submitted, delivered to or received
by, filed with or registered by the
Registrar via an electronic system
identified, established or maintained
by the Registrar for that purpose,
tﬁ’at document, endorsed as required,
with the word “Registered”, may be

rovided in electronic form, to the
irm or person registering.



No. 16

Finance 2026

455

(3) Any document to be submitted
or delivered to or received by, filed
with or registered by the Registrar,
shall be submitted in the manner
determined by the Registrar pursuant
to this section and must be accompanied
by valid identification documents and
any other supporting documents, as
specified by the Registrar.”.

27. The Registration of Business Names Act is chap. s2s5
amended in section 2A—

(@)

in subsection (1), by deleting the words
“may determine” and substituting the
words “shall determine”; and

(b) by inserting after subsection (2), the

following subsection:

“(3) Any document to be submitted
or delivered to or received by, filed
with or registered by the Registrar
General, shall be submitted in the
manner determined by the Registrar
General pursuant to this section and
must be accompanied by valid
identification documents and any other
supporting documents, as specified by
the Registrar General.”.

28. The Liquor Licences Act is amended—

(@)

in section 20A—

(i) in subsection (1), by deleting the
word “twenty” and substituting
the word “thirty-three”; and

(i1) by inserting after subsection (6),
the following subsections:

“(7) The holder of a licence
specified under section 35(3) or
(4) who fails to comply with
subsection (1), commits an
offence and 1is liable on
summary conviction to a fine of
twenty-five thousand dollars
and to a term of imprisonment
for one year and the licence
issued under this Act may be
revoked.

amended

Chap. 84:10
amended



456 No. 16 Finance 2026

(8) For the purposes of
this section, “amusement
game” has the meaning
assigned to it by section 10 of
the Gambling and Betting
Act.”;

(b) 1in section 20B—

(i) by repealing subsections (1), (1A)
and (1B) and substituting the
following subsections:

“(1) There shall be charged
on every amusement game
operated on premises referred
to in section 20A, including an
electronic roulette device, a
tax to be known as the “gam-
ing tax”.

(1A) Subject to this section,
the gaming tax under subsec-
tion (1) shall be—

(a) in the case of an
amusement game,
other than an
electronic roulette
device, three thousand,
one hundred and
twenty-five dollars
per quarter in
respect of each
amusement game;
and

(b) in the case of an
electronic roulette
device, thirty
thousand dollars per
quarter in respect of
each device.

(1B) Subject to this section, the
gaming tax payable under
subsection (1A) shall be payable
on or before the first day of each
quarter.



No. 16

Finance 2026

457

(1C) Notwithstanding subsection
(1B) and section 20B(2), where a
licence is granted after the
commencement of any quarter,
the gaming tax for that quarter
shall be—

(a) payable in full; and

(b) due and payable
within fifteen days
from the commence-
ment of that quarter
or within fifteen
days of the date on
which the licence is
granted in that
quarter, whichever
is later.

(1D) In this section, “electronic
roulette device” means a gaming
device that automatically spins a
ball around a mechanical roulette
wheel and determines the
outcome of a round of play via
electronic sensors.

(1E) For the purposes of this
section, “quarter” means a period
of three months in a calendar
year and shall be construed as
follows:

(a) the first quarter,
from 1st April to
30th June;

(b) the second quarter,
from 1st July to
30th September;

(¢) the third quarter,
from 1st October to
31st December; and

(d) the fourth quarter,

from 1st January to
31st March.



458

No. 16

Finance 2026

(1F) Notwithstanding subsection
(1B) and section 20B(2), the gaming
tax for the period 1st April, 2026
to 30th June, 2026, shall be
payable within thirty days of the
commencement of this section.

(1G) Where, in respect of the
year 2026, a person has paid
gaming tax in accordance with
the rate applicable prior to the
commencement of this section,
that amount shall be treated as
gaming tax in excess of the
amount in respect of which the
licence holder is properly chargeable
under subsection (6), and the
licence holder shall be entitled to
have the tax so paid in excess,
refunded to him in accordance
with that subsection.”;

(i1) in subsection (2)—

(A) in the chapeau, by
deleting the words “every year
commencing from the year
2015” and substituting the
words “every quarter
commencing from the first
quarter of the year 2026”; and

(B) in paragraph (b), by
inserting after the words
“licensed premises”, the words
“in accordance with subsection
(1B) and (1C), as applicable”; and

(iii) by repealing subsection (9);
in section 20C—

(i) in subsection (2), by deleting the

word “year” and substituting the
word “quarter”; and



No. 16

Finance 2026

459

amended—

(i1) by inserting after subsection (7),

the following subsection:

“8) For the purposes of
subsection (2), “quarter” has
the meaning assigned to it by
section 20B(1E).”;

(d) in section 53, by deleting the words

(e)

@

“fifteen thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “seventeen thousand, five
hundred dollars”;

in section 54(1), by deleting the words
“fifteen thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “seventeen thousand, five
hundred dollars”; and

in section 64, by deleting the words
“fifteen thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “twenty thousand dollars”.

29. The Income Tax (In Aid of Industry) Act is chap. ss:04

(a) 1in section 2, by inserting after subsection

(4), the following subsection:

“(5) For the purposes of Parts II
and III, “marginal marine gas
field” means an offshore shallow
water field with recoverable gas 2C
contingent resources estimated at
three hundred billion cubic feet or
less and an internal rate of return
of less than fifteen per cent as a
standalone project, which comes
into production after 1st January,
2026, and is certified by the
Minister with responsibility for
energy and energy industries as a
marginal marine gas field.”;

(b) in section 17A, by inserting after

subsection (2), the following subsection:

amended



460 No. 16 Finance 2026

“(2A) Notwithstanding subsection
(2), where, on or after 1st January,
2026, a person carrying on
production business incurs
expenditure on the provision of
machinery or plant for use in
connection with a marginal marine
gas field, there shall be made to him
an allowance of twenty per cent,
calculated on a straight-line basis on
an amount equal to one hundred
and thirty per cent of that
expenditure, for each of the five
consecutive years commencing with
the year of income in which the
expenditure is incurred.”;

(¢) in section 24, by inserting after
subsection (1), the following subsection:

“(1A) Notwithstanding subsection
(1), where, on or after 1st January,
2026, a person carrying on
production business incurs
expenditure to which this Part
applies in respect of a marginal
marine gas field, in ascertaining
the chargeable income of such
person, there shall be made to him
an allowance of twenty per cent,
calculated on a straight-line basis
on an amount equal to one hundred
and thirty per cent of that
expenditure, for each of the five
consecutive years commencing with
the year of income in which the
expenditure is incurred.”; and

(d) by inserting after section 24, the
following section:

“Certification 24A. (1) The Minister
ofmarginal  yith responsibility for energy
faas -~ and energy industries may
certify that a field is a
marginal marine gas field
for the purposes of sections

17A and 24.



No. 16

Finance 2026

461

30. The Spirits and Spirit Compounds Act is cChap. 8754

amended—

(2) In determining whether to
issue a certificate under subsection
(1), the Minister with responsibility
for energy and energy industries
shall be satisfied that the field—

(a) is an offshore field;

(b) has recoverable gas
reserves estimated at
three hundred billion

cubic feet or less;

(¢) has an internal rate of
return of less than
fifteen per cent as a
standalone project; and

(d) comes into production
after 1st January,
2026.

(3) The Minister with responsibility
for energy and energy industries
may require an applicant to submit
such documents, information or
calculations as the Minister
considers necessary to determine
whether the field satisfies the
criteria set out in subsection (2).

(4) Where the Minister with
responsibility for energy and
energy industries issues a certificate
under subsection (1), the Minister
shall notify the Board of Inland
Revenue.

(5) A certificate issued under
subsection (1) shall be conclusive
evidence, for the purposes of
sections 17A and 24, that the field
is a marginal marine gas field.”.

(a) in section 7(3), by deleting the words

“eight thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “twelve thousand dollars”;

(b) in section 30(1), by deleting the words

“one thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “five thousand dollars”;

amended



462 No. 16 Finance 2026

(¢c) in section 30(2), by deleting the words
“eight thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “twelve thousand dollars”;

(d) in section 65(2), by deleting the words
“nine hundred and sixty dollars” and
substituting the words “five thousand
dollars”;

(e) in section 75, by deleting the words “ten
thousand dollars” and substituting the
words “twelve thousand dollars”;

(f) in section 79(2), by deleting the words
“eight thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “twelve thousand dollars”;

(g) in section 95(2), by deleting the words
“two thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “eight thousand dollars”; and

(h) in section 122(2), by deleting the words
“two thousand dollars” and substituting
the words “five thousand dollars”.

Act No. 7 of 2019 31. The Non-Profit Organisations Act is amended
amended in section 3A—

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting the words
“may determine” and substituting the
words “shall determine”; and

(b) by inserting after subsection (2), the
following subsection:

“(8) Any document to be submitted
or delivered to or received by, filed
with or registered by the Registrar
General, shall be submitted in the
manner determined by the Registrar
General pursuant to this section and
must be accompanied by valid
identification documents and any
other supporting documents, as
specified by the Registrar General.”.



No. 16 Finance 2026 463

Passed in the House of Representatives this 10th day
of June, 2026.

—

Clerk of the House

Passed in the Senate this 12th day of June, 2026.

/2

Clerk of the Senate

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, CARONI
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2026



